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C hronic pain is a significant con-
tributor to disability among 
Americans, with an estimated 
51.6 million people experienc-

ing chronic pain that lasts longer than 
three months. (Rikard, Strahan, Schit, & 
Guy, 2023). Regardless of its source -– 
whether medical or unexplained origin – 
chronic pain can have detrimental effects 
on physical, psychological, and social 
well-being, significantly impacting the 
quality of life for those affected. Due to 
these detrimental effects, mental health 
therapists are essential in helping chronic 
pain sufferers manage their condition. 
However, many chronic pain sufferers do 
not seek mental health services due to 
feeling unaccepted, disbelieved, and dis-
empowered by mental health providers 
(Darlow et al., 2013). The best way for 
mental health therapists to understand the 
impact of chronic pain is by learning di-
rectly from those experiencing chronic 
pain, who can provide insights into the 
challenges associated with chronic pain 

(Apkarian, Baliki, & Geha, 2009; Suso-
Ribera, Camacho-Guerrero, McCracken, 
Maydeu-Olivares, & Gallardo-Pujol, 2014). 

Even though exploration of the lived 
experiences of chronic pain sufferers may 
uncover potential approaches that thera-
pists can use with clients experiencing 

chronic pain, there is limited research 
(Osborn & Rodham, 2010). To contribute 
to this gap in the chronic pain literature, I 
interviewed 10 individuals with chronic 
pain who were between the ages of 42 and 
65 and currently lived with chronic pain. 
Chronic pain durations ranged from four 

to 10 years. I asked open-ended questions 
that centered around the challenges of 
living with chronic pain. 
 

Stigma 
 
All interviewees reported stigma, rang-

ing from doctors not believing pain in-
tensity to challenges obtaining pain med-
ications to friends not believing their 
chronic pain.  

One interviewee explained, “I feel like a 
criminal picking up my meds. Yes, they are 
opioids, but I am not an addict; I am in 
pain…Every time I pick up my meds, the 
pharmacy tech gives me the ‘disgusted’ look.”  

All interviewees limit discussions with 
family and friends regarding their treatment 
because some view them as “druggies” or 
“just faking it to get pain pills.”  

Another interviewee said, “Since I do 
not have a visible injury, it is difficult 
coping with the misunderstanding from 
others. Some question whether I am lying 
about my pain intensity.”  

Another interviewee reported harass-
ment when using Costco handicapped 
parking spaces. “People say I am lying to  
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T he multidimensional suffering 
encompassed by chronic pain 
conditions, combined with their 
prevalence, demands a multidis-

ciplinary approach to management. The 
direct impact that chronic pain has on 
physical distress, as well as emotional 
state, sleep, stress levels, and coping sys-
tems, highlights the importance of behav-
ioral health integration. There is a bidirec-
tional relationship between chronic pain 
and behavioral health conditions - with 
chronic pain conditions increasing the risk 
for the development of behavioral health 
problems and chronic pain being a symp-
tom commonly experienced by individu-
als with behavioral health conditions. So-
cial determinants of chronic pain (including 
poverty, unemployment, adverse childhood 
events such as abuse, and exposure to vio-
lence) necessitate the integration of social 
interventions with clinical interventions. 
Resultant psychological, social, and func-
tional impairments related to the experi-
ence of chronic pain may exacerbate disa-
bility in this population (Kohrt, Griffith, 
& Patel, 2018). 

A person-centered approach includes 
timely access to behavioral health interven-
tions, physical and behavioral health care 
coordination, addressing health-related so-
cial needs, and education around self-
management strategies (Eaton et al., 2015). 
The approach incorporates behavioral health 
treatments, such as cognitive behavior thera-
py, trauma-focused psychotherapy, and be-
havioral activation, with psychosocial inter-
ventions to enhance social support. This 
approach targets the transdiagnostic features 
of chronic pain (impaired emotional regula-
tion, sleep disturbance, avoidant coping, and 
demoralization) that can fuel further physi-
cal and emotional distress. It also addresses 
the physical, psychological, and social im-
plications of living with chronic pain 
(Kohrt, Griffith, & Patel, 2018). 

The variability in how individuals expe-
rience pain underscores the use of a bi-
opsychosocial framework for effective 
management. Chronic stress states can 
make individuals more sensitive to the 
experience of pain and at higher risk for a 
host of maladaptive coping responses. 
Individuals with a history of trauma are at 
a particularly elevated risk of demoraliza-
tion due to a cycle of aversion responses 
combined with motor, autonomic, and 
endocrine system activation, which can 
worsen both pain and psychological suf-
fering. As the intensity and duration of 
such distress increases, the subsequent 
demoralization can impact the risk of sui-
cide if it progresses to feelings of hope-
lessness, helplessness, and further despair. 
Psychotherapy can be a valuable tool in 
introducing hope and motivating positive 
behavioral change via various psychother-
apeutic approaches (De Figueiredo & 
Griffith, 2016). 

Community Care Behavioral Health 
Organization (Community Care), a non-
profit behavioral health managed care 
organization part of the UPMC Insurance 
Services Division, is committed to ensur-
ing access to evidence-based behavioral 
health treatment and physical-behavioral 
health integration. Given that individuals 

who have serious behavioral health condi-
tions are a medically vulnerable popula-
tion, the integration of physical and be-
havioral health services is an existing fo-
cus and initiative to improve the physical 
health status of these individuals that can 
also be applied to populations experienc-
ing chronic pain. Community Care’s Be-
havioral Health Home Plus model is a 
comprehensive approach to physical and 
behavioral health integration as part of 
treatment and recovery for adults with 
serious behavioral health conditions or 
opioid use disorder. The model incorpo-
rates wellness coaching, effective coordi-
nation, collaboration between physical 
health and behavioral health providers, 
and population health learning collabora-
tives. Case managers and certified peer 
specialists serve as “health navigators” to 
assist individuals in achieving health and 
wellness goals. The model supports whole
-person care by creating an environment 
of wellness, activating individuals to bet-
ter manage their overall health, and at-
tending to social determinants of health. 
The model’s learning collaboratives dis-
seminate education, tools, and resources 
to providers around topics that pertain to 
collaborative care, including the impacts 
of traumatic stress and social determinants 
of health on chronic pain. Community 
Care has also provided education around 
physical-behavioral health integration to 
Pennsylvania HealthChoices’ contracted 
Federally Qualified Health Centers 
(FQHC) via behavioral health-focused 
learning sessions, during which the topic 
of behavioral activation for individuals 
with chronic pain has been presented. 

UPMC Community HealthChoices is 
one of three Managed Care Organizations 
(MCOs) that manage Pennsylvania’s Com-
munity HealthChoices program. Plan med-
ical directors provide behavioral health 
case consultation for UPMC’s Community 
HealthChoices service coordinators to 
support individuals with complex physical 
and behavioral health needs, often includ-
ing chronic pain. These are opportunities 
for case-by-case discussion around chal-
lenges in chronic pain management -

including social determinants of health 
needs and social impairments associated 
with chronic pain, the importance of co-
ordinated multidisciplinary care and em-
phasizing behavioral health interventions 
that promote engagement with the pain 
providers. Educational sessions are of-
fered to UPMC Community HealthChoic-
es providers by Community Care via a 
summer institutes series, and topics in-
clude the intersection of chronic pain and 
substance use disorders. 

Digital applications offer opportunities 
to promote self-management strategies 
that can be uniquely valuable in chronic 
pain management. Community Care of-
fers members access to a free mobile 
wellness application called RxWell that 
provides health coaching to support self-
management strategies and improve over-
all wellness through several behavioral 
health and lifestyle program offerings. It 
also provides educational content and 
activities based on cognitive behavior 
therapy to increase resilience and promote 
behavioral change. 

Pharmacological interventions for pain 
management, particularly reliance on opi-
oid analgesics, can be fraught with risks, 
including diversion, addiction, and over-
dose. The opioid epidemic further high-
lights the importance of the implementa-
tion of mitigation strategies (Volkow & 
McLellan, 2016). UPMC Health Plan and 
Community Care provide opioid educa-
tional resources to providers. Pharmacy 
initiatives include provider outreach to 
promote evidence-based opioid prescrib-
ing, early prevention of opioid use disor-
der via identification of high-risk mem-
bers and referral for various interventions, 
and overdose prevention strategies. This 
also includes a robust opioid/medication-
assisted treatment (MAT) outreach pro-
gram implemented by UPMC Health Plan 
Pharmacy. The program identifies mem-
bers using high dose opioids where the 
risk of overdose and addiction is elevated, 
those with concurrent potentiators on 
board (thus increasing risk of overdose),  
 

see Suffering on page 38 
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Improving Staff and Patient Satisfaction with Compliance Technology 

By InvisALERT Solutions 
ObservSMART 
 
 

I n Healthcare, behavioral health ex-
periences significant challenges, 
including physical and psychological 
components of patient well-being. 

Successfully addressing these challenges 
involves integrating data-driven technolo-
gy into quality of care. This article delves 
into the correlation between behavioral 
health and patient and staff satisfaction, 
emphasizing the transformative role of 
technologies. 

Traditional rounding methods on the 
market today often have limitations that 
do not consider the complex care work-
flows of behavioral health and the im-
portance of compliance. They are con-
fined to a block of time without assurance 
that staff were with patients during obser-
vation. In contrast, proximity-required 
compliance-driven tools can offer a shift 
by ensuring consistent check-ins on pa-
tients without confining them to their 
rooms and encouraging a true 15, 30, or 
60-minute interval. This shift ensures pa-
tient safety and staff engagement, enhanc-
ing the patient's well-being. 

Proximity-required technology like 
ObservSMART promotes staff engage-
ment and fosters collaboration and rapport 
between patients and staff. By giving staff 
the front-line tools they need, with re-
minders and alerts to make certain that 
patients are seen every 15, 30, and 60 
minutes, rather than blocks of time, 
healthcare staff establish stronger relation-
ships and gain deeper insights into pa-
tients' needs and there is less opportunity 
for incidents. This heightened engagement 
allows personalized care tailored to indi-
vidual needs and conditions in real time, 
elevating patient satisfaction levels. 

Central to effective patient safety and 
care management is recognizing behavior-
al health and pain as a multifaceted expe-
rience encompassing both physical and 

psychological distress (APA). Technolo-
gies can integrate assessments, including 
pain and depression scales, into routine 
rounds, enabling comprehensive patient 
well-being evaluation. Through easy ac-
cess to documentation and analysis of 
patient progress, staff members can 
promptly identify areas requiring inter-
vention, optimizing treatment and patient 
satisfaction (ObservSMART). 

Moreover, technology like Ob-
servSMART addresses not only patient 
safety but can also ensure environmental 
safety. By consistently monitoring pa-
tients and their surroundings, the risk of 
falls – a common concern in healthcare 
settings – is also significantly mitigated. 
Consistent checks reduce the likelihood of 
adverse events associated with medicated-
induced drowsiness or impaired mobility, 
fostering a safer care environment. 

Technology that offers an integrated 
data-driven approach to patient care pro-
vides real-time insights into physical and 
psychological aspects of patient well-
being. ObservSMART reporting and in-
app reporting allow staff members to 
quickly identify trends and patterns in 
patient data, facilitating informed decision
-making and proactive interventions. By 
leveraging technology to gather and ana-
lyze data points that suggest areas for im-
provement- whether physical, mental, or 
emotional- staff can customize treatment 
plans to address patients' evolving needs 
much more effectively. 

Compliance technology can support 
health management initiatives and pro-
mote preventive care measures. In behav-
ioral health settings, staff may use histori-
cal data to identify trends for patients at 
risk of self-harm, falls, suicide, pain, 
elopement, and many other concerns. This 
approach improves overall environmental 
awareness and contributes to significant 
cost savings by mitigating risk. 

Technology can also improve staff and 
patient satisfaction by ensuring patient safety 
and staff engagement, supporting complex 

workflows, and promoting a better quality 
of care. By leveraging the capabilities of 
compliance tools like ObservSMART, 
healthcare organizations achieve better oper-
ational efficiency and communication. As 
technology continues to evolve, the role of 
compliance technology in healthcare will 
only become more essential in improving the 
staff and patient experience. 

Compliance technology not only im-
proves patient and staff satisfaction but 
also contributes to the overall efficiency 
of healthcare. By utilizing technology, 
staff can document patient progress while 
providing real-time insights. Using round-
ing technology in behavioral health set-
tings may reduce administrative burdens, 
minimize paperwork errors, and stream-
line communication between care teams. 
This improved efficiency allows 
healthcare organizations to allocate re-
sources more effectively, reduce opera-
tional costs, and ultimately improve pa-
tient care quality. 

Furthermore, using portable, proximity-
required technology eliminates the need to 
constantly go back and look at hours of 
video footage to know if staff are com-
pleting their observations with patients. 
Physicians have greater confidence that 
patients are being checked on and don't 
feel the need to automatically default to a 
1:1. The technology also allows for tighter 
observation intervals (i.e., 5 or 7 minutes), 
as opposed to defaulting to a 1:1. This can 
free up staff for other patient care 
(ObservSMART). 

Compliance technology seamlessly 
integrates with electronic health record 
(EHR) systems. Tools that integrate with 
EHR systems can update patient records, 

document care interventions, and provide 
real-time alerts and notifications to care 
teams. This integrated approach to 
healthcare improves communication, re-
duces medical errors, and enhances pa-
tient safety and satisfaction. 

In conclusion, consistent checks, staff 
engagement, data, and technology offer a 
transformative approach to facilitate staff 
and patient satisfaction and quality of care 
in behavioral health, with various symp-
toms such as depression and chronic pain. 
By using innovations like proximity-
required monitoring technology, personal-
ized care delivery, and proactive risk miti-
gation, you empower care teams to navi-
gate complex healthcare landscapes confi-
dently, improving the patient and staff 
experience. 

 
Technologies like ObservSMART are 

determined to find a solution to ensure 
adherence to safety protocols and posi-
tively influence patient experiences. For 
more information, reach out to 
cshows@invisalertsolutions.com or visit 
www.observsmart.com. 
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New York Health Equity Reform:  
 

A Transformative Shift in New York’s Medicaid Landscape 
By Joshua Rubin, MPP 
Principal 
Health Management Associates 
 
 

O n January 9, 2024, New York’s 
Department of Health received 
its long-awaited amendment to 
our Medicaid 1115 demonstra-

tion, newly rebranded NYHER (NY Health 
Equity Reform). It’s not as flashy nor as 
generously funded as the special purpose 
DSRIP (Delivery System Reform Incentive 
Payment) demonstration, but it’s likely to 
have a longer-lasting impact. DSRIP al-
ways had a beginning, a middle, and an 
end. NYHER is here to stay because NY-
HER is the 1115 that serves as the founda-
tion of our Medicaid system. It’s been in 
place, in one form or another, since 1997. 

NYHER has added a new cornerstone 
to New York’s Medicaid system. Now, in 
addition to healthcare services (always the 
core of Medicaid) and the later added 
behavioral health services (including 
HARP, CORE, and HCBS), we are add-
ing services for health-related social needs 
(HRSN) to this policy authority that un-
derlies our system. We are in the process 
of defining a certain set of human services 
as “medically necessary.” It might seem 
obvious that food and shelter are 
“medically necessary,” but it took Medi-
caid six decades to get there. 

New benefits will include nutrition sup-
port, housing support, transitional hous-
ing, transportation, case management, and 
screening for HRSN. The benefits will be, 

however, limited to a subset of the Medi-
caid population, children, and people with 
complex and/or chronic health conditions 
and/or social complications. In 2027, the 
roughly $1.4 billion per year set aside to 
pay for medically necessary HRSN ser-
vices will be rolled into the managed care 
capitation rate, a new stone in New York 
Medicaid’s foundation. 

In addition to adding new services, the 
state is determined to add new providers. 
Somewhere between nine and 13 (NYC 
will have somewhere between one and 
five), new Social Care Networks (SCN) 
are currently being procured to create 
networks of community-based organiza-
tions (CBOs) that provide HRSN services. 
SCNs are intended to weave together the 
CBOs in a region, providing them with 

billing support, quality improvement pro-
cesses, technology infrastructure, and (at 
least someday) negotiating leverage. Like 
lead health homes, independent practice 
associations (IPA), and regional health 
information organizations, they are de-
signed to provide the connective tissue 
that enables healthcare services to func-
tion in an organized way. They are de-
signed with a business model the state 
expects to outlive half a billion dollars of 
start-up funding. When the results of the 
SCN procurement are announced, we will 
know how attractive that business model 
is. I predict much interest. 

Although funding for HRSN services 
and the SCNs that enable them is the larg-
est portion ($3.7 billion) of the $6.7 bil-
lion investment, the amendment has other 
important components. $700 million has 
been set aside to address New York’s 
healthcare workforce crisis. $48 million is 
set aside to forgive loans for people work-
ing in the safety net system. An additional 
$646 million will be used to recruit new 
direct care workers and provide career 
ladder training to existing licensed, cre-
dentialed, and unlicensed care providers. 

Importantly, the new approval makes a 
meaningful dent in the stigma baked into 
the Medicaid system when it was created 
in the 1960s, waiving something called 
the IMD (Institutions for Mental Diseas-
es) exclusion, a rule as outdated as its 
name. Simply put, services that would 
otherwise be reimbursable by Medicaid 
haven’t been because they have been pro-
vided in a substance use disorder (SUD) 

setting (an IMD). Now, providers will be 
able to receive Medicaid revenue for these 
services even if they’re provided in a 
SUD setting. A waiver of the similarly 
archaic IMD exclusion for mental health 
settings is reportedly being processed. 

Another significant investment ($2.2 
billion) is being made to move some 
struggling hospitals from a fee-for-service 
payment system to a global budget model. 
In exchange for desperately needed opera-
tional support, these hospitals (about a 
dozen hospitals spread across four coun-
ties downstate) will have to move toward 
a global payment system, offering some 
financial certainty and predictability 
through an alternative payment model. 

Lastly, the state’s proposal for healthcare 
planning infrastructure was approved, alt-
hough somewhat diminished. The state had 
proposed a set of Health Equity Regional 
Organizations (HERO…the approval’s best 
acronym) echoing the SCN regions. While 
HERO still accounts for about 2% of the 
waiver dollars, only one HERO is approved 
to cover the whole state. 

The approval has set off a race to utilize 
these dollars wisely, assess their impact, 
and plan for their sustainability…all be-
fore April 1, 2027. The SCN procurement 
is underway. Others are sure to follow. 
The Department of Health has an enor-
mous amount of work to do, as do provid-
ers of different kinds across the state. It is 
going to be a busy three years. 

 
Joshua Rubin, MPP, is Principal at 

Health Management Associates. 

Joshua Rubin, MPP 

By Grace Hennessy, MD 
Associate Chief Medical Officer  
for Addiction Psychiatry 
New York State Office of Addiction 
Services and Supports (OASAS) 
 
 

A n estimated 20% of adults in 
the United States experience 
chronic pain (Zelaya, 2020). 
For many years, opioid analge-

sics were the primary medications pre-
scribed for chronic pain, but the significant 
increase in opioid prescriptions at high 
doses and for long durations has been asso-
ciated with unprecedented increases in 
opioid use disorder, overdose, and death 
(Dowell, 2022). Concerns about these po-
tential complications of prescribing opioids 
for chronic pain management, along with 
limited evidence of their long-term effec-
tiveness, are reflected in national guide-
lines that strongly encourage the use of 
non-opioid and non-pharmacologic treat-
ments for chronic pain (Dowell, 2022). 

In recent years, medical cannabis, de-
fined as cannabis or cannabinoid medica-
tion used as medical therapy to treat medi-
cal conditions or alleviate symptoms, has 
emerged as an alternative to opioids for 
chronic pain treatment. Currently, medical 
cannabis is legal in 38 states and the Dis-

trict of Columbia, with pain as the most 
common qualifying condition (ProCon.org, 
2023). Among adults with chronic pain 
living in states with medical cannabis laws, 
25% have used medical cannabis, demon-
strating the growing interest in this treat-
ment option (Bicket, 2022). 

Cannabis contains more than 60 canna-
binoids, with Δ9-tetrahydrocannabinol 
(THC) and cannabidiol (CBD) being the 
most active at the cannabinoid receptors. 
Although the mechanisms by which canna-
binoids produce analgesia are not fully un-
derstood, activation of the two cannabinoid 
receptors found in the brain, spinal cord, 
and immune cells decreases pain and in-
flammation (Hill, 2017). THC, the main 
psychoactive compound in cannabis, pro-
duces effects such as euphoria and anxiety 
and has effects on pain, muscle relaxation, 
nausea, and appetite stimulation (Legare, 
2022). Conversely, non-psychoactive CBD 
similarly affects pain and muscle relaxation 
and has anti-inflammatory, antioxidant, and 
anticonvulsant effects. Medical cannabis that 
combines THC and CBD may be better than 
THC alone for the treatment of pain because 
CBD may both enhance and oppose certain 
pharmacologic effects of THC (Johnson, 
2010; Russo, 2006; Hayakawa, 2008). 

The effectiveness of medical cannabis 
as a chronic pain treatment has been the 
subject of numerous clinical trials. To 
date, three systematic reviews of clinical 
trials found that the use of cannabis-based 
medications by adults with chronic pain 
was associated with a higher incidence of 
pain reduction when compared to placebo 
(Whiting, 2015; Solmi, 2022; McDonagh, 

2022). These studies also found medical 
cannabis was more likely than placebo to 
produce adverse events such as dry 
mouth, dizziness, drowsiness, nausea, and 
vomiting. While providing important evi-
dence about the effectiveness of and ad-
verse events associated with medical can-
nabis, most studies included in the re-
views were short-term, lasting from one to 
six months, and primarily focused on 
adults with neuropathic pain, limiting the 
generalizability of the findings. 

 Another focus of research studies has been 
the relationship between medical cannabis for 
chronic pain and changes in prescription and 
illicit opioid use. Indeed, opioid prescriptions 
decreased by 14.4% after states implemented 
medical cannabis laws (Bradford, 2018). 
Additionally, in several studies, adults using 
medical cannabis for chronic pain have re-
ported decreased use of opioids (Boehnke, 
2016; Sohler, 2018; Okusanya, 2020; 
Takakuwa, 2020), although one study found 
an association between medical cannabis use 
and increased use of opioids and other 
prescription medications (Caputi, 2018). 
The cross-sectional nature of these studies 
and the reliance on self-reporting, howev-
er, limits the applicability of the results to 
the larger population of adults with  
 

see Cannabis on page 38 

Does Medical Cannabis Treat Chronic Pain?  

Grace Hennessy, MD 
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A “Prescription” for Integrated Care 
 

for Chronic Pain and Associated Conditions  
By Ashley Brody, MPA, CPRP 
Chief Executive Officer 
Search for Change, Inc. 
 
 

A rising incidence of physical 
pain, and chronic physical pain 
in particular, necessitates a 
comprehensive examination of 

its underpinnings and relationship with 
other dimensions of health and wellbeing. 
This poses unique challenges for behavior-
al healthcare providers who operate amid 
a deeply entrenched dualism that contin-
ues to treat “mind” and “body” as separate 
phenomena. Despite recent advances in 
integrated care and a broader recognition 
of the role of Social Determinants of 
Health (SDoH) and Health Related Social 
Needs (HRSN) in health outcomes, pro-
viders operating in New York State re-
main subject to highly Balkanized licens-
ing and regulatory structures that impede 
fully holistic approaches. The mere exist-
ence of separate governmental entities 
charged with oversight of healthcare and 
social welfare providers (e.g., Department 
of Health, Office of Mental Health, Office 
of Addiction Services and Supports, etc.) 
perpetuates models of care designed to 
treat discrete constellations of symptoms 
in lieu of people. The widespread comor-
bidity of physical and behavioral health 
conditions coupled with prevalent psycho-

social and environmental stressors under-
scores the urgency to address all health 
and social welfare challenges in an inte-
grated manner. An emerging body of re-
search suggests individuals dually diag-
nosed with chronic pain and behavioral 
health conditions are at exceptional risk of 
adverse outcomes in the absence of fully 
integrated and holistic approaches. 

Physical pain is commonly defined as 
“chronic” if it persists for at least three 

months, and it afflicts approximately one-
fifth (20%) of American adults (Reid, 
2024). Chronic pain is associated with 
decreased quality of life and diminished 
productivity and, by some estimates, ac-
counts for $635 - $650 billion in medical 
expenses annually (Vadivelu et al., 2017). 
Its incidence has also increased in recent 
years, particularly among individuals at 
lower socioeconomic levels (Huzar, 
2021). One investigation revealed a 14% 
increase in the incidence of chronic pain 
between 2002 and 2018 among financially 
stable individuals (i.e., those whose 
household income was four times the pov-
erty level) and a 42% increase among 
those whose household income was only 
twice the poverty level (Huzar, 2021). 
When chronic pain is present in individu-
als with mental health conditions and oth-
er significant life challenges, its effects 
are frequently debilitating. 

Extensive research has explored the as-
sociation between Major Depressive Dis-
order (MDD) and chronic pain, and many 
findings affirm a reciprocal relationship 
between these conditions. MDD is present 
in 5% of the general population, but its 
incidence rises precipitously among indi-
viduals with chronic pain. One study found 
that 30% - 45% of chronic pain patients 
also meet the MDD criteria (Demyttenaere 
et al., 2007). Most researchers agree this 
relationship is multifaceted and cannot be 
attributed to a singular cause. Investiga-
tions of myriad biological, social, environ-
mental, and psychological mechanisms 
underpinning this association have pro-
duced competing hypotheses and opened 
additional avenues of inquiry. 

Nevertheless, the disparate incidence of 
chronic pain and depression among mem-
bers of select socioeconomic and demo-
graphic populations indicate these, more 
than other factors, account for this rela-
tionship and reinforce its reciprocity. In 
addition, individuals dually diagnosed 
with chronic pain and MDD are at greater 
risk of opioid misuse and abuse. Some 
studies have demonstrated patients with 
MDD are more likely to receive opioid 
medications and in higher doses than pa-
tients without MDD. This trend poses 
obvious health and safety implications in 
view of an enduring opioid abuse epidem-
ic that has had particularly deleterious 
effects on vulnerable populations (Edlund 
et al., 2010). This trend also underscores 
the imperative to promote alternative in-
terventions for chronic pain and MDD 
that address the social, psychological, and 
environmental conditions that perpetuate 
these conditions. To this end, initiatives 
that target individuals’ social care needs 
should improve their overall quality of 
life and mitigate stressors known to exac-
erbate chronic pain and depression. 

Research concerning the relationship 
between chronic pain and other forms of 
mental illness is comparatively limited, 
although some studies have revealed cor-
relations between chronic pain and vari-
ous personality and neurodevelopmental 
disorders. For instance, individuals with a 
diagnosis of borderline personality disor-
der (BPD), a personality disorder charac-
terized by affective dysregulation, an un-

stable sense of self, and volatile interper-
sonal relationships, are more likely than 
members of the general population to ex-
perience chronic pain (Sansone & San-
sone, 2012). Various causal mechanisms 
underpinning this association have been 
posited, including some that implicate 
iatrogenic factors. Healthcare profession-
als frequently stigmatize individuals with 
BPD since their behaviors may be per-
ceived as “difficult” and their symptoms 
a product of personal choice or 
“misbehavior” (Sheehan, Nieweglowski, 
& Corrigan, 2016). Healthcare providers 
who harbor such beliefs (if only on an 
implicit level) regarding individuals with 
BPD are inclined to regard patients’ 
symptoms with skepticism or outright 
contempt. This skepticism may extend to 
patients’ reports of chronic pain and pre-
clude the accurate identification of causes 
and potential treatments for pain (Newton 
et al., 2013). Instances of practitioner bias 
are surely not limited to patients with 
BPD, and such bias amid dual behavioral 
health and opioid abuse epidemics poses a 
grave threat to the most vulnerable mem-
bers of our community. 

Recent advances in integrated care and 
increased attention to the conditions in 
which people live, learn, work, and social-
ize promise to mitigate stressors known to 
exacerbate disorders of all types for which 
conventional (i.e., medically driven) ap-
proaches have proven ineffective. New 
York State is poised to achieve additional 
progress following the federal govern-
ment’s approval of a Medicaid Waiver 
under Section 1115 of the Social Security 
Act through which healthcare and social 
welfare providers may claim additional 
resources to address individuals’ social 
care needs. By no means is this initiative a 
panacea for our ailing health and social 
welfare system, but its potential to further 
the cause of integrated care may yield 
enduring benefits for the most vulnerable 
among us, including those who must en-
dure chronic pain and other impediments 
to health and wellbeing. 

 
For more information, contact Ashley 

Brody, MPA, CPRP, at (914) 428-5600 
(x9228) or abrody@searchforchange.org. 
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By Nancy Harvey, LMSW 
Chief Executive Officer 
Service Program for Older People (SPOP) 
 
 

A rmand is a 78-year-old gay 
man who has lived with chron-
ic pain for over ten years.  A 
retired actor who enjoyed a 

successful career on stage and as a mentor 
for young actors, he now has multiple 
health conditions including arthritis, a 
history of cancer, and complications from 
spinal surgery.  He is able to ambulate 
only with assistance and he rarely leaves 
his home.  He was referred to the SPOP 
clinic two years ago with symptoms of 
major depressive disorder and generalized 
anxiety disorder, and at intake he indicat-
ed that he felt isolated, fearful, depressed, 
and worried about his finances. 
SPOP (Service Program for Older People) 
is the only agency in New York City that 
is entirely focused on providing commu-
nity-based behavioral and mental 
healthcare to adults age 55 and older.  Our 
primary program is a behavioral health 
clinic that provides treatment at our office 
and 20 satellite locations in the city, via 
telehealth, and in the home for clients 
who are deemed homebound due to physi-
cal or psychiatric disability.  We work 
with hospitals, older adult centers, and 
other aging services providers to reach out 
to adults who would not otherwise have 
access to behavioral healthcare, including 
those who are marginalized as a result of 
poverty, disability, race, ethnicity, sexual 
orientation, gender expression, or other 
factors. 

Armand’s case stands out as an exam-
ple of an individual who was already at 
risk for physical or mental health dispari-
ties – he is financially disadvantaged, gay, 
isolated, medically frail, and lacking fa-
milial supports.  His overall fragility was 
further exacerbated by chronic pain and 
an inherent mistrust of the healthcare sys-
tem after decades of feeling the need to 
hide his sexual orientation from providers. 

Recognizing the complexity of his pro-
file, we paired him with an especially 
empathic clinical social worker with ex-
pertise in chronic illness and lived experi-
ence as an LGBTQA+ person.  He met 
with her using telehealth, quickly estab-
lished a therapeutic rapport, and worked 
toward treatment goals to manage his de-
pression and anxiety.  He also enrolled in 
a therapy group at SPOP for older adults 

with chronic illness and pain, where he 
was able to share compassionate support 
with others who were also living with 
pain.  The increased social contact boost-
ed his mood, and the group enhanced the 
work that he was doing with his individu-
al therapist. 

One of Armand’s greatest challenges 
was the fact that he was entirely alone, 
with no family, partner, or advocate – a 
situation that is all too common among 
older adults in the LGBTQA+ communi-
ty.  His therapist reached out to the 
Friendly Visiting Program at SAGE, the 
national center for advocacy and support 
for older LGBTQA+ adults, and they con-
nected him to a volunteer visitor who has 
now been with him for 18 months.  She 
has become a good friend and a reliable 
source of companionship and conversa-
tion, and her visit is a high point of Ar-
mand’s week. 

Armand’s therapist also connected him 
to other community resources including 
home-delivered meals, legal services for 
advance care planning, and an affordable 
assisted living facility where he has ap-
plied for housing. He is currently engaged 
in a form of life review therapy where he 
reflects on the highlights of his life and 
career, and he often breaks into song dur-
ing his sessions.  While he continues to 
live with serious medical challenges and 
pain, he has a far more positive life view 
and feels less alone on his life journey. 

SPOP serves adults age 55 and older 
and about 75% of our client population is 
over age 71.  Hospitals and medical pro-
viders are among our leading sources of 

referrals, and at least two-thirds of our 
clients are managing a serious medical 
condition or chronic pain.   

Pain and mental illness share the same 
system circuitry in the body – the central 
nervous system – and they impact one 
another both neurologically and emotion-
ally.  We know that pain exacerbates the 
risk of suicidality in older adults and we 
have learned that somatic therapy, which 
focuses on the body, can reduce the im-
pact of pain.  All of our clinicians are 
trained in the use of somatic techniques, 
such as breathing, visualization, and re-
laxation exercises, which help to release 
muscle tension and address physical dis-
comfort and pain while also reducing 
symptoms of anxiety, depression, and post
-traumatic stress.   

Physical pain is highly subjective, and 
we often see clients who feel desperate for 
validation and acknowledgement of their 
pain.  We use therapy groups to address 
this challenge, as participants acknowledge 
the feelings of one another in a supportive 
setting.  We also connect clients to other 

community supports, such as friendly 
visiting and home-delivered meals, to 
address social isolation and concrete 
needs.  And we prescribe medications for 
mental health needs that can sometimes 
also improve pain. 

Armand is just one of hundreds of cli-
ents we will see this year who suffer from 
chronic pain.  He is older and frailer than 
when he first came to SPOP, but he now 
feels he is in control of his life.  He has 
learned techniques to manage his pain and 
mental health symptoms, is less isolated, 
and has a plan in place if he is no longer 
able to live in his apartment.  He has 
found deeper meaning in his life’s work, 
as he recalls his days on the stage during 
therapy sessions, and he treasures his rela-
tionship with his Christy, his friendly visi-
tor.  Physical pain is still part of his life, 
but it no longer defines him. 

 
Visit www.spop.org to learn more about 

SPOP and its role as a community-based 
behavioral healthcare provider for older 
adults in New York City. 

Nancy Harvey, LMSW 

Aging, Pain, and Behavioral Health Challenges – Untangling the Threads  

Visit our Sister Publication Autism Spectrum News  
For a Library of Autism Resources and Support 

 

AutismSpectrumNews.org 
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Seeing Through Crisis: A Behavioral Health Approach to Chronic Pain 

By Issy Francis, BSN, RN, 
and Dani York, LCAT, RDT 
Services for the UnderServed (S:US) 
 
 

P ain is a subjective experience, 
which means it is influenced by 
an individual’s perceptions, emo-
tions, beliefs, and cultural fac-

tors. When assessing pain, healthcare pro-
viders rely heavily on the individual’s self
-report to understand the nature, intensity, 
and impact of their pain experience. In 
other words, “pain is what the patient says 
it is” (Miller et al., 2017). Pain is not al-
ways directly correlated with observable 
signs or specific physiological changes. 
Therefore, healthcare providers must trust 
and respect the individual’s self-report of 
pain, even if it does not align with objec-
tive measures or expectations. Validating 
and addressing the individual’s pain expe-
rience is essential for providing compas-
sionate and effective care. In addition to 
the use of evidence-based assessment 
tools such as the Numeric Rating Scale 
(NSR), The Visual Analog Scale (VAS), 
and the Verbal Descriptor Scale (VDS), 
behavioral observation provides a view 
into the unique experience of pain. Behav-
ioral observation can indicate pain 
through facial expressions, vocalizations, 
body movements, and decreased activity 
levels (Cook et al., 2012). However, pain 
may also be expressed through a range of 
emotional responses. 

Pain is broken down into acute pain and 
chronic pain. Chronic pain is a broad term 
that encompasses a range of embodied 
experiences. It is defined as persistent or 
recurring pain that lasts for an extended 
period, typically beyond the expected 
healing time of an injury or illness, usual-
ly lasting for three months or longer 
(Chronic Pain, n.d.). For people in treat-
ment and recovery, chronic pain may be 
the result of trauma, a significant medical 
condition(s), or both. It often presents as 
physically debilitating and emotionally 

destabilizing, placing individuals in crisis. 
It can lead to conditions like depression, 
anxiety, and even exacerbate pre-existing 
mental health issues. 

Conversely, mental health challenges 
such as stress or trauma can worsen the 
experience of chronic pain. It is crucial 
for behavioral health providers to under-
stand that chronic pain can increase vul-
nerability, amplify pain, and increase the 
risk for suicide and suicide ideations 
(Dydyk, 2023). Pain may also lead to long
-standing substance use and isolation. 
Mistrust of helping professionals because 
of negative encounters with providers, 
treatment-resistant pain, and other barriers 
to care often prohibit participants from 
seeking treatment, thus continuing the 
crisis cycle. At Services for the Under-
Served (S:US), the Treatment and Recov-
ery Services team recognizes the critical 
importance of developing healthy and 
trusting rapport with people served, ac-
knowledging the factors contributing to 
ruptures in, and barriers to essential care. 
Understanding pain as a crisis creates an 
opportunity to address the complex fac-
tors that result in distress. 

S:US is one of the largest community-
based health and human services organi-
zations in New York State. It works inten-
tionally and daily to correct societal im-
balances by providing comprehensive and 
culturally responsive services. The agency 
offers treatment and recovery services to 
address a vast range of needs – focusing 
on mental health, wellness, and substance 
use recovery – impacted by social deter-
minants of health. For individuals who, 
because of chronic pain, have experienced 
co-morbid mental health and substance 
use challenges, the emotional impact is 
vast and dangerous. Therefore, treatment 
at the S:US Wellness Works Certified 
Community Behavioral Health Clinic 
(CCBHC) provides treatment and recov-
ery services to those individuals through 
person-centered and uniquely individual-
ized interventions. The CCBHC model 
ensures that any individual who walks 
through their door has access to excel-
lence in care for mental health and sub-
stance use treatment needs. S:US’ 
CCBHCs immediately connect individu-
als with an integrated team of profession-
als to assess the individual’s stated needs 

and extend wrap-around care.   
Chronic pain often intersects with men-

tal health in complex ways. The role of 
providers in treatment and recovery set-
tings is to address the distress caused by 
chronic pain from a holistic approach, 
tending to the physiological and psycho-
logical components at the core of pain. A 
range of emotions accompany the body’s 
response to pain. “One of the most disrup-
tive features of pain is the emotional dis-
tress. The typical emotional reaction to 
pain includes anxiety, fear, anger, guilt, 
frustration, and depression” (Linton et al., 
2011). Emotional crises are deeply per-
sonal and impact functioning: individuals 
are unable to work, attend vocational pro-
grams, feel disorganized or disoriented, 
experience shame, engage in substance 
use to curb unwanted thoughts and feel-
ings, or act with impulsivity. Many re-
main unable to actuate self-care behav-
iors. From a crisis management approach, 
it is essential to address both the physical 
and psychological aspects of pain manage-
ment to optimize outcomes and promote 
healing. “The challenge is to assess risk 
and to manage the crisis without acting in 
ways that the patient experiences as invali-
dating or minimizing their problems while, 
at the same time, fostering autono-
my” (British Psychological Society, 2009). 
Providers fortify these goals through ex-
panded therapeutic lenses.  

A case example to illustrate some of the 
treatment approaches used at S:US is that 
of EG. EG is a 60 y/o Latin man treated at 
the S:US Wellness Works CCBHC in 
Brooklyn. He was referred by his support-
ive residence case manager in the context 
of uncontrolled outbursts of anger, verbal 
aggression toward others, and escalated 
threats of violence. Following intake and 
evaluation, EG was given diagnoses of 
Bipolar Disorder, Antisocial Personality 
Disorder, Chronic Obstructive Pulmonary 
Disease, Chronic Viral Hepatitis C, Hu-
man Immunodeficiency Virus (HIV) dis-
ease, and Opioid Dependence in remis-
sion. EG self-reported chronic back pain, 
which contributed to significant distress. 
Treatment focused on the emotional com-
ponents that aggravated the distress 
caused by pain.   

Managing chronic pain often requires a 
comprehensive and multidisciplinary ap-
proach, involving various healthcare pro-
viders such as physicians, pain specialists, 
physical therapists, psychologists, and 
other allied health professionals (Staudt 
MD, 2022). EG was referred to the Psy-
chiatric Nurse Practitioner for an evalua-
tion to assess for medical and mental 
health comorbidities, and the treatment 
team collaborated with his medical pro-
viders and housing residence to wrap-
around care and decrease the potential for 
harm. Twice weekly sessions mitigated 
against negative outcomes.   

Early in treatment, EG presented as 
volatile, projecting anger towards the 
therapeutic alliance. He spoke about the 
lack of support and effective medical in-
terventions specific to his pain, exacerbat-
ed by a history of trauma and years of 
incarceration and institutionalization. EG 
perceived danger around him yet  
 

see Crisis on page 26 
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NYSPA Report - Chronic Pain and Behavioral Health: 
 

Underlying Data and Regulatory Responses 
By Rachel Fernbach, Esq,  
and Jamie Papapetros 
New York State Psychiatric Association 
 
 

T he Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention (CDC) defines 
chronic pain as pain lasting 
more than three months that can 

result from an underlying medical disease 
or condition, injury, medical treatment, 
inflammation, or unknown cause.1 Stud-
ies find a strong correlation between pain 
and mental health conditions2, and indi-
viduals living with chronic pain are at 
increased risk for depression, anxiety, and 
substance use disorders. Data published 
by the CDC estimates nearly 21% of US 
adults (51.6 million persons) experience 
chronic pain, and nearly 7% (17.1 million 
persons) experience high-impact chronic 
pain.3 The CDC reported chronic pain as 
the leading cause of disability in the Unit-
ed States in 2019.4 

The intersection between chronic pain 
and behavioral health conditions is well-
documented.5 According to the CDC, 
chronic pain has been linked with depres-
sion, Alzheimer’s disease and related de-
mentias, higher suicide risk, and sub-
stance use and misuse6, and a 2017 study 
found that 35-45% of individuals with 
chronic pain also experience depression.7 
The Anxiety & Depression Association of 
America reports chronic pain disorders 
are common in those with anxiety disor-
ders.8 In 2023, new research from The 
University of Arizona estimated that near-
ly 1 in 20 adults in the US experience co-
occurrence of chronic pain and anxiety or 
depression, which results “in functional 
limitations in daily life.”9 

Jennifer S. De La Rosa, PhD, Director 
of Strategy for The University of Arizo-
na Health Sciences Comprehensive Pain 
and Addiction Center and lead author of 
the study, stressed the importance of the 
results, stating, “The study’s findings 
highlight an underappreciated popula-
tion and health care need – the interde-
pendency between mental health and 
chronic pain.” 

In 2020, Mental Health America 
(MHA) released a report with data col-
lected from its online mental health 
screening program that identified a con-
nection between mental health and chron-
ic pain.10 The MHA report includes an 
analysis of the responses from over 
161,000 individuals who completed the 
screening between 2015 and 2019 who 
were experiencing both chronic pain and 
mental health conditions. Among the 
main findings of the report: 
 
• Individuals with arthritis or other 

chronic pain are more likely to screen 
positive or moderate to severe for a 
mental health condition (79%) than the 
general screening population. 

• 48% of people who completed the 
PTSD screening reported a chronic 
health condition and chronic pain. 

• Veterans and active-duty military are 
the special population groups most af-
fected by arthritis or chronic pain. 

In addition, individuals with chronic 

pain were more likely to have also re-
ceived treatment or support for their men-
tal health than those without chronic pain. 
The MHA report notes that “People who 
experience adversity or emotional or phys-
ical trauma in childhood also have a high-
er risk of chronic pain in their adult lives. 
Fifty-five percent of people who have ex-
perienced multiple adverse childhood ex-
periences (ACEs) have chronic pain.” 

The MHA report suggested policy and 
practice recommendations, including 
urging primary care physicians to initiate 
proactive conversations about chronic 
pain and mental health, engaging in trau-
ma-informed care, patient-centered care 
and use of shared decision-making tools, 
integrating peer support, expanding in-
terdisciplinary teams, investing in re-
search for tools that work with diverse 
populations and incorporating such re-
search into medical school curricula. In 
addition, the report calls for behavioral 
health services “as a central feature of 
care for arthritis or other chronic pain” 
and adds, “care should include a focus 
on trauma, stress, anxiety, depression, 
PTSD, coping skills, and resilience-

building as opposed to solely substance 
use-focused services and supports.” 

Various stakeholders prepared the fed-
eral Pain Management Best Practices 
Inter-Agency Task Force Report and in-
cludes a series of best practices for man-
aging acute and chronic pain, including 
medications, restorative therapies, inter-
ventional procedures, behavioral health 
approaches, and integrative health.11 The 
report devotes several pages to addressing 
patients with both chronic pain and men-
tal health and substance use comorbidi-
ties, stating, “Given the intersection be-
tween psychiatric/psychological symp-
toms and chronic pain, it is important that 
the behavioral health needs of patients 
with pain be appropriately and carefully 
evaluated and treated with the concurrent 
physical pain problem.” 

Healthcare leaders and regulators have 
also addressed these issues. Effective July 
1, 2019, The Joint Commission (the 
“Commission”) expanded its pain assess-
ment and management standards applica-
ble to behavioral healthcare organizations. 
These standards are an important tool for 
acknowledging the intersection of chronic 
pain and co-occurring mental illness and 
substance use disorders. The Joint Com-
mission is a global nonprofit organization 
that accredits and certifies more than 
22,000 healthcare organizations and pro-
grams across the United States. It offers 
voluntary accreditation and certification 
of healthcare organizations, programs, 
and services and focuses on ensuring safe 
and high-quality patient care. The Com-
mission also develops standards for care 
delivery that form the basis of its evalua-
tion process. 

The Commission publishes the R3 Re-
port (referring to Requirement, Rationale, 
and Reference), which summarizes the ra-
tionale and references for Joint Commission 
evaluation requirements. Issue 20 of the R3 
Report, issued on December 21, 2018, out-
lines the following additional requirements 
that apply, among others, to accredited be-
havioral healthcare organizations. 

 
see Responses on page 39 
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By Michael B. Friedman, LMSW 
 
 

L ike many people, I live with 
pain every day. I’m lucky that, 
for the most part, my pain is 
tolerable and doesn’t interfere 

too much with my life. I walk slowly—
but I walk. I sleep badly, but I sleep. It’s 
tough to sit in a car going long distances. 
Fortunately, my wife now does the driv-
ing, and we can travel for a few hours at a 
time. I’m often grouchy, but I still have 
people I enjoy being with and who seem 
to enjoy being with me. I’m sometimes 
very distressed that my body has betrayed 
me, but I also get a great deal of satisfac-
tion from the things that I do. There are 
medications other than opioids that help 
when I need them. Usually Tylenol. 
Sometimes cortisone. I have to be very 
careful about the medications I take be-
cause I have diabetes and chronic kidney 
disease. The anti-depressants often used 
now for my kind of pain make me impo-
tent. Some doctors have urged me to take 
them anyway. “What does sex matter at 
your age?” I’ve been asked. On to the 
next doctor. 

Ten years ago, the pain I had to live 
with was much worse. Over a period of 
two years, I lost the ability to walk except 
very, very slowly with a walker. I used a 

wheelchair so that I didn’t delay others 
too much. The pain would become so bad 
that it brought me close to tears, and on 
those occasions, I used an opioid or, pref-
erably, vodka—a very effective painkiller. 
Eventually, after seeing about fifteen 
medical professionals, a tumor inside my 
spinal column, putting pressure on the 
spinal cord, was discovered. It was re-

moved. I learned to walk again; my pain 
diminished so that I was no longer tempt-
ed by opioids. But my spinal cord is dam-
aged and deteriorating. Thus, constant 
pain in my leg.  

So, I know a thing or two about chronic 
pain, about the experience of it, about the 
disheartening, angering impact of it. As I 
did some research to prepare to write this 
piece, I began to wonder whether the profes-
sionals who give advice about how to live 
with pain really understand what it’s like. 

The advice they give sounds right and 
is pretty much the same as the advice that 
mental health professionals give for eve-
rything—coping during the pandemic, 
delaying dementia, tolerating the slings 
and arrows of life in a troubled world, etc.  

For example, in its article on coping 
with chronic pain, the Cleveland Clinic 
notes, “Four major lifestyle factors can 
affect your chronic pain and help mini-
mize it.” Four “pillars,” they call them. 
They are - get ready for this - reduce 
stress, exercise, eat well and sleep well. 

Give me a break! As if, being told this, 
my eyes would be opened, and I would 
calm down, go to the gym, give up the 
foods that make me happy, and, just like 
that, close my eyes in a room without a 
TV at night and sleep peacefully except 
for getting up to pee. 

It’s good advice, of course. But it is as 

hard to take as it is easy to give.  
Reduce stress? Ok, maybe I could do 

meditation or practice “mindfulness,” what-
ever that is. But stress has been my lifestyle 
forever; it is hard to change now. Do the 
experts have any idea how stressful it is to 
work or socialize while in pain? Or how 
stressful it is not to know when pain is go-
ing to make it impossible to do what you’ve 
planned or to find anything pleasurable?  

Exercise? Off the couch, Mr. Potato! 
Hell, I’m not on the couch. I’m at the 
computer writing, editing photographs 
(I’m a semi-professional photographer), 
trying to read (did I mention my macular 
degeneration?) Etc. Not to mention the 
fact that I, like millions of others with or 
without chronic pain, just don’t have the 
discipline to exercise, and telling us that 
we should doesn’t help much. A little 
more guilt, some additional self-loathing. 
Not to mention the fact that exercise is 
painful when you’ve got chronic pain! 

Eating well? Come on—this is the most 
obese nation in the world. Besieged by 
advertising for delicious fast foods filled 
with calories and God knows what else 
that’s bad for you. Not to mention that 
foods and drinks that make us happy and 
help us cope with stress, like ice cream 
and martinis, are not what we should be  
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Coping With Chronic Pain: 
 

Good Advice is Easy to Give But Hard to Take  

By Jorge R. Petit, MD 
Quality Healthcare Solutions, LLC 
 
 

I n a landmark move, the U.S. Depart-
ment of Health and Human Services 
(HHS), through CMS, announced 
today the Innovation in Behavioral 

Health (IBH) Model. This initiative is a 
game-changer in healthcare, especially for 
underserved and marginalized communi-
ties where health disparities are most pro-
nounced. This new model supports the 
President’s mental health strategy and 
implements an action item in the HHS 
Roadmap for BH Integration. 

For the last decade or so I have been a 
strong advocate for developing and imple-
menting on the vision of a “no wrong 
door, one-stop shop” access to high quali-
ty, person centered, accessible, affordable, 
timely and culturally and linguistically 
integrated array of medical, behavioral 
and social care supports, needs, services 
and treatments. I firmly believe this is 
possible and within our reach. This new 
model is exactly all that and, in my esti-
mation, Certified Community Behavioral 
Health Clinics (CCBHCs) are the obvious 
setting where to integrate and provide this 
array of integrated services. 
 

Why Integration Matters 
 

 Holistic Approach: Behavioral health 
is inseparable from physical health. The 
IBH Model acknowledges this intercon-

nection by integrating mental health, 
substance use disorder treatment, and 
social supports with traditional medical 
services. 

 Improving Access in Marginalized 
Communities: Health disparities are 
more prevalent in marginalized com-
munities due to factors like economic 
instability, racial discrimination, and 
inadequate access to healthcare. The 
IBH Model’s emphasis on community-
based, inter-professional teams can 
significantly improve access to compre-
hensive care in these areas. 

 Breaking Down Barriers: The tradition-
al separation of physical and behavioral 
health services leads to fragmented care 
and poorer outcomes. This model pro-
motes a no wrong door approach, ensur-
ing that irrespective of how individuals 
enter the healthcare ecosystem, they will 
have access to a full spectrum of services. 

 Technology as a Catalyst: The model's 
focus on health IT infrastructure is piv-
otal. In communities where digital liter-
acy and access are barriers, enhancing 
health IT can lead to better manage-
ment of health records, appointment 
scheduling, telehealth, and remote con-
sultations, thereby improving patient 
outcomes. 

 Economic Benefits: By providing inte-
grated care, the model aims to reduce 
overall healthcare costs. This is particu-
larly beneficial for underserved com-
munities, where economic barriers of-
ten prevent access to quality healthcare. 

 Empowering Communities: The mod-
el isn’t just about healthcare delivery; 
it’s about empowerment. Educating and 
engaging communities in their health 
management can lead to sustained im-
provements in health outcomes. 

The Road Ahead 
 

The IBH Model is set to launch in Fall 
2024 and operate for eight years in up to 

eight states. This is a significant step to-
wards a more equitable healthcare system. 
However, its success will depend on ef-
fective implementation, continuous evalu-
ation, and community engagement. 

In my continued advocacy of integrated 
care and in light of this new model and 
the recent approval of NYS’s 1115 Waiv-
er Amendment I am heartened and opti-
mistic about what is to come. We should 
all monitor the roll-out of this innovative 
model and the potential impact this will 
have on those most in need. Let’s remain 
hopeful and proactive. It’s time to em-
brace a healthcare system that is based on 
personal dignity, equity and sees the indi-
vidual as a whole, finally recognizing the 
inextricable link between the brain, body, 
and all the health-related social factors. 
Check out my last bog on Healthcare's 
New Frontier: Addressing Social Deter-
minants for Better Outcomes. 
 

This article has been republished with 
permission. The original article, published 
on January 12, 2024, can be found here. 

Jorge R. Petit, MD, is a Behavioral 
Healthcare Leader, Author, and Founder/
CEO of Quality Healthcare Solutions, 
LLC. Dr. Petit is also a long-time Board 
Member and past Chair of Mental Health 
News Education, the publisher of Autism 
Spectrum News and Behavioral Health 
News. For more information, visit his web-
site: www.drjpetit.org, blog: Behavioral 
Health: Matters, LinkedIn: Dr. Jorge Petit, 
MD, or Substack: drjrpetit.substack.com. 

Jorge R. Petit, MD 

Revolutionizing Healthcare: The Future of Integrated Care for All 

Michael B. Friedman, LMSW 
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By Barry B. Perlman, MD 
 
 

A t its core, the idea of “Recovery” 
expresses an amalgam of aspira-
tion and hope. From practice, I 
learned that each patient has 

highly individual ideas of recovery. Exam-
ples: A man was pleased when a change 
from a traditional antipsychotic to clozap-
ine, a more potent medication, meant a 
diminished frequency of psychiatric hos-
pitalizations and improved function at 
home. A woman with a history of recur-
rent depression and opioid dependency 
felt a sense of personal triumph after 
successfully coming off methadone 
maintenance therapy even as she sus-
tained a stable mood. For another, it was 
being able to live in supportive housing 
while being employed in a supportive 
work situation.  

Understanding what recovery means for 
those with serious and persistent mental 
illness (SPMI) is important because New 
York State, with a population of 19.5 mil-
lion, is estimated to be home to 846 thou-
sand adults with SPMI, about 5.4 % of its 
adults. In truth, SPMI touches all of us 
because it affects many families and com-
munities as a consequence of homeless 
mentally ill living on our streets and sig-
nificantly impacts the state budget both 
directly and through Medicaid. Those des-
ignated as having SPMI are persons large-

ly diagnosed with Schizophrenia, Bipolar 
Disorder, refractory Major Depression, 
intractable Post-Traumatic Stress Disor-
der, and severe Obsessive Compulsive 
Disorder.  

Perhaps the reason that recovery from 
SPMI is harder to understand than from the 
flu or a fracture is that nothing is visibly 
amiss. Their recovery is closer to someone 
who has incurred a stroke in that the extent 

to which they may regain various functions 
is not apparent at the time of the event. 
Across their lifetimes, those with SPMI 
usually have a bumpy up-and-down course 
with periods of advancement punctuated 
by relapses. The aim of treatment is to 
assist each individual to progress as far as 
possible in reaching their personal poten-
tial. As such, recovery remains an ongoing 
story without a predetermined destination.  

Fortunately for New Yorkers, the NYS 
Office of Mental Health licenses a broad 
array of “recovery-oriented services” 
meant to assist persons with SPMI de-
pending on their needs at differing times. 
These services are the tools of recovery; 
they include crisis services, inpatient hos-
pital admission, partial hospitalization, 
continuing day programs, housing offer-
ing differing levels of support, and differ-
ing intensities of community-based care 
from clinics to intensive outreach pro-
grams. It is useful for families to familiar-
ize themselves with the array of available 
services in order to better advocate with 
mental health professionals on behalf of 
their loved ones with SPMI.  

 A case synopsis of a patient I treated 
for decades provides a sense of which 
services are utilized during periods of 
acute illness and “recovery.” First seen as 
a college freshman because of depression, 
what followed was entirely unexpected. 
Early on, his condition severely deterio-
rated, requiring multiple psychiatric hos-

pitalizations and extensive use of Electro-
convulsive therapy after psychiatric med-
ications failed to arrest his slide. Once his 
acute illness stabilized, he began to re-
build his life. He benefitted from the 
structure of a Continuing Day Treatment 
program while remaining in therapy. 
Over several years, he moved from his 
parent’s home through various levels of 
supportive housing before being able to 
live independently. All the while, he 
managed to graduate from college and 
attend graduate school. Spiritual counsel-
ing provided enrichment unavailable 
through psychotherapy. At my retirement, 
he was a married man and father, a suc-
cessful social worker, and an adjunct pro-
fessor of social work. It was an outcome 
neither of us could have foreseen and 
know to be rare. Appropriately, he con-
tinues in treatment.*  

These case vignettes make clear the 
need for humility about the prognoses of 
those with SPMI seeking mental health 
care. Where the recovery journey may 
lead often can’t be foreseen at the begin-
ning of treatment. To carry the journey as 
far as possible, we must keep working 
together with clinicians, patients, and 
families, employing available modalities. 
Along the way, a person with SPMI will 
benefit from differing combinations of 
services. Setbacks are discouraging for 
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Recovery: An Ongoing Process, Not a Destination 

Barry B. Perlman, MD 
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Chronic Pain, Quality of Life, and Suicidal Behavior 

By Thomas Grinley MBA, CMQ/OE, 
CLYB, Program Planning and Review 
Specialist, New Hampshire Department 
of Health and Human Services 
 
 

I n the mid-1970s, Quality of Life 
(QOL) was identified as a key medi-
cal concept (Berlim and Fleck, 
2003). Readily adopted in oncology, 

the concept spread through different 
fields of medicine and eventually to psy-
chiatry. Many tools were developed to 
take QOL from a subjective concept to a 
measurable attribute. Some of these tools, 
such as the Quality of Life Interview and 
the Wisconsin Quality of Life Index, 
were designed specifically to measure 
QOL for individuals with severe and per-
sistent mental illness. 

Balazs et al. (2018) noted that QOL can 
be a significant mediator between peer 
and emotional problems and suicidal be-
havior in adolescents. Hoefer (2020), not-
ing the sparsity of similar work with 
adults, found that life-altering events 
(divorce, grieving, isolation) significantly 
impacted the quality of life. Hoefer ar-
gued these became enabling conditions 
for attempting suicide. 

Hadi et al. (2019) found that “The mul-
tidimensional negative impact of chronic 
pain leads to poorer QoL among patients 
with chronic pain compared to the general 
population and patients with other long-

term conditions.” Chen et al. (2023) made 
a direct connection between chronic pain 
and suicidal behaviors. They found that 
scoring just one standard deviation above 
the mean for pain had a 51% higher risk 
of suicidal behavior. Many others have 
followed this path, and the link between 
chronic pain, quality of life, and suicidal 
behavior is now well established.  

Themelis et al. (2023) emphasized, 
“Living with chronic pain has been identi-
fied as a significant risk factor for sui-

cide.” In fact, after accounting for mental 
health disorders, 8.8% of deaths by sui-
cide can be attributed to chronic pain. 
Using the most recently available suicide 
statistics, that is more than 4,000 people 
losing their lives to suicide because of 
chronic pain. We know that deaths by 
suicide are but a fraction of thoughts of 
suicide, so it is a significant factor in all 
suicidal behaviors. They discussed the 
concept of mental defeat as part of this 
link between chronic pain and suicidal 

behavior. Tracing the concept from work 
on trauma, they identified the link be-
tween mental defeat and chronic pain as 
being recognized by 2007, with “mental 
defeat defined as negative appraisals of 
self in relation to pain.” Catastrophic 
thinking about chronic pain can lead to 
this mental defeat. 

Gibbs (2021) made a simple observa-
tion that “suicide happens when the out-
ward pressures of life are greater than the 
inward ability to cope in that moment.” 
Chronic pain leads to catastrophic think-
ing, leads to mental pain, leads to suicidal 
behavior. The pain simply becomes too 
much to bear. 

Grinley and Gillan (2023) stated that 
addressing quality of life was key to re-
ducing suicidal behaviors. However, it is 
difficult to address quality of life without 
first addressing the chronic pain at the 
root of poor QOL. 

Hadi et al. found six themes linking 
chronic pain with QOL: “interference 
with physical functioning, interference 
with professional life, interference with 
relationships and family life, interference 
with social life, interference with sleep, 
and interference with mood.”  

At this point, however, it becomes im-
portant to distinguish between different 
types of suicidal behavior. Those who 
take their lives by suicide are a fraction of  
 

see Life on page 33 
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Insights from Personal and Professional Frontlines 

By Steve Miccio  
CEO 
People USA 
 
 

L iving with chronic pain is a 
physically exhausting experi-
ence that extends far beyond 
physical discomfort. I know this 

both from my own lived experience with 
peripheral neuropathy and major nerve 
damage and as the CEO of People USA, a 
peer-led non-profit that serves individuals 
with behavioral health challenges, many 
of whom struggle with chronic pain as 
well. It is an unrelenting companion that 
often brings along adverse mental health 
and cognitive impacts. The physical pain 
and subsequent mental health struggles 
can completely reshape an individual’s 
life. Understanding these complexities is 
crucial for effective coping strategies and 
improved quality of life. Chronic pain has 
a profound impact on overall quality of 
life, including mental wellbeing. Accord-
ing to a survey conducted by the Ameri-
can Pain Society, over 50% of individuals 
living with chronic pain report experienc-
ing moderate to severe disruptions in their 
daily activities, social relationships, and 
emotional wellbeing. 

I was 17 when I began to feel pain in 
my feet and legs. I ignored the pain and 
continued being youthful and playing 
sports, mountain climbing, working and 
even skydiving regularly. When I reached 
my twenties, the pain grew to a level 

where I could barely walk, and finally had 
to use a wheelchair by the time I hit 30.  

Research suggests that chronic pain can 
lead to structural and functional changes 
in the brain. Areas associated with pro-
cessing pain, such as the prefrontal cortex 
and limbic system, may undergo altera-
tions, affecting cognitive processes. Addi-
tionally, the constant barrage of pain sig-
nals can overload the brain's capacity, 
disrupting its ability to focus and concen-
trate. That is what happened to me. I can 
personally relate to individuals we serve 
at People USA who often report difficul-
ties with memory, attention, and decision-
making. This cognitive fog, commonly 
referred to as "pain brain," can be debili-

tating, impacting everyday tasks and over-
all productivity. 

Beyond cognitive challenges, chronic 
pain takes a toll on mental wellbeing. It is 
common for individuals to experience 
depression, anxiety, and mood disturb-
ances as they navigate the complexities of 
their condition. The relentless nature of 
pain can wear down resilience, leading to 
feelings of hopelessness and despair. In 
fact, studies have shown that individuals 
with chronic pain are at a significantly 
higher risk of experiencing depression. I 
was severely depressed in my 30’s even 
though I was on medication that allowed 
me to walk. However, the pain never went 
completely away. According to research 

published in JAMA Psychiatry, 30-50% 
of individuals with chronic pain also meet 
the criteria for clinical depression. 

Moreover, chronic pain often disrupts 
sleep patterns, exacerbating psychological 
distress. Sleep disturbances not only con-
tribute to mood disorders but also further 
exacerbate cognitive difficulties, creating 
a vicious cycle of pain, sleeplessness, and 
mental challenges. It was in my 30’s that I 
was hospitalized in a psychiatric hospital. 
I was in severe distress. 

Furthermore, the emotional impact of 
chronic pain extends beyond the individu-
al suffering. Family members and care-
givers often experience heightened stress 
and emotional strain as they witness their 
loved one’s struggle with pain. This dy-
namic can strain relationships as it did for 
me and create additional challenges in 
coping with chronic pain. Many of the 
individuals we serve at People USA be-
come isolated from their loved ones, 
which causes an added layer of loneliness 
and despair. The link between chronic 
pain and suicidal ideation is significant. A 
study published in the Journal of Pain 
Research found that individuals with 
chronic pain are three times more likely to 
report suicidal ideation compared to those 
without chronic pain. The study under-
scores the urgent need for mental health 
support for chronic pain patients. 

Individuals grappling with chronic pain 
encounter numerous hurdles, yet there are  
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Chronic Pain and Its Impacts:  
 

An Overview and Possible Management Options  
By Veera Mookerjee, PhD, LMSW 
Founder/Director 
Resolveera 
 
 

W hen a person goes through 
depression, the impact of 
that weight can manifest in 
the form of physical pain 

and other bodily discomfort. On the other 
hand, chronic pain has a significant effect 
on behavioral health. Recurring physical 
pain can lead to mood swings, lack of 
appetite, lack of self-care, changes in be-
havior and attitudes, as well as isolation. 
 

What Is Chronic Pain and Its Impact  
 

Chronic pain, as defined by Johns Hop-
kins Medicine, “is long standing pain that 
persists beyond the usual recovery period 
or occurs along with a chronic health con-
dition. It may affect people to the point 
where they can’t work, eat properly, par-
ticipate in physical activity, or enjoy life.”  

The physical manifestation of chronic 
pain can have an emotional impact on the 
person experiencing the pain, which can 
easily transform into depressive symp-
toms. Chronic pain is recurring for at least 
90 days, daily or frequently. Chronic pain 
could be a repeated health condition due 
to seasonal triggers or issues like lack of 

mobility. Pain measurements range from 
mild to severe and require timely, accessi-
ble, and accurate management.  
 

Current Findings on Chronic Pain 
 

A recent NIH study in 2023 demonstrat-
ed that chronic pain among adults in the 
USA is a frequently occurring new health 
condition when compared with diabetes or 

hypertension. The study claims that the 
impact of chronic pain is about “21% 
among adults” (Nahin RL, Feinberg T, 
Kapos FP, Terman GW, Estimated Rates 
of Incident and Persistent Chronic Pain 
Among US Adults, 2019-2020). Chronic 
pain, a continuous feeling of discomfort of 
various intensities, is a condition that lim-
its the way we function and our ability to 
focus. Chronic pain is notorious for turn-

ing people into substance abusers as they 
try to numb the pain.  

Going by the NIH study, chronic pain 
is like a pandemic. Pain affects one indi-
vidual but can potentially impact that 
individual's caregivers. From identifying 
the pain triggers to effective treatment, 
pain engulfs the person who experiences 
the variety of pain intensity and the care-
giver equally. Both keep trying ways to 
control the pain at their levels. Nearly all 
of us have experienced mild to severe 
pain in our lives. As mentioned before, 
pain that keeps recurring is chronic. Pain 
has both physical and psychological im-
pacts on an individual, ranging from tem-
porary mobility issues to substance abuse 
in the form of excess pain medication 
used to control the experience and inten-
sity of pain. Often, with chronic pain is-
sues, uncontrolled pain refers to a stage 
when pain medication is in use as pre-
scribed by the provider. Still, due to age, 
environmental triggers, or the chronic 
nature of the pain, there is no change in 
the severity of the pain. In such situa-
tions, often, a person uses trial and error 
methods to control pain, hence creating a 
very high chance of pain medication 
abuse or overdose. Referring to the same 
NIH study, chronic pain  
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75 Years: AHRC New York City to  
 

Celebrate Milestone Anniversary on May 13th, 2024 
By AHRC New York City 
 
 

I t is with pride in an unsurpassed histo-
ry and great hope for the future that 
AHRC New York City kicks off its 
75th year with a Gala on May 13th. The 

organization began in 1948 with a $3 ad in 
the New York Post placed by Ann Green-
berg, a Bronx housewife whose young son 
with developmental disabilities had been 
denied access to school. She was looking 
for other parents to form a play group, and 
the response was overwhelming. Within a 
year, hundreds of New York City families 
of children with disabilities had banded 
together to create what would, within a 
decade, become a grassroots human rights 
movement of great magnitude that spanned 
across the city and the country.  

Many other disability organizations had 
their start later in the 1950’s, but AHRC 
NYC was the trailblazer. Its power was, 
and remains, its family roots.  
 

The Power of Families 
 

Founded by parents and still governed 
by a Board comprised primarily of family 
members, the credo that propels the or-
ganization in all it does is based on the 
idea that people with developmental disa-
bilities are entitled to access and oppor-
tunity so they can live full and equitable 

lives. The organization’s history is one of 
not only providing supports – some of the 
“firsts” in the field - but also of advocacy. 
From being a plaintiff in the Willowbrook 
lawsuit to calling for change in legislation 
and public policy, advocating for better 
education, living arrangements, prospects 
for work, and fuller lives in the communi-
ty, AHRC NYC led the way. In its earlier 
years, AHRC NYC was at the forefront of 

leading the newly arising provider com-
munity in its advocacy efforts and in de-
veloping provider associations. Reflecting 
on our history, Board President Ray Fer-
rigno, a parent of a young man with au-
tism, sums it up well, “There are many 
challenges to be met. But whatever the 
obstacle, our sense of resolve is unshake-
able. That is the major lesson we learned 
from our founders. We have made enor-

mous strides in all these years, but there 
is still so much to be done.” 

AHRC NYC’s 75th Anniversary is a 
celebration of far more than the organiza-
tion. The event celebrates the history of 
services and supports for people with de-
velopmental disabilities in New York 
City, the achievements made by people 
with developmental disabilities and their 
families, the dedication of the entire pro-
vider community, as well as many differ-
ent community partners who have em-
braced AHRC NYC’s vision of a world 
where the power of difference is em-
braced, valued, and celebrated.  
 

Honoring Champions 
 

The May 13th Gala will reflect on 
AHRC NYC’s legacy and embrace a fu-
ture of growth, championing the rights 
and opportunities of people with disabili-
ties. The event’s Hall of Honor will rec-
ognize individuals and groups for their 
exceptional dedication and contributions 
to the intellectual and developmental disa-
bilities community, shaping the legacy of 
AHRC NYC. The Hall of Honor includes: 
Maureen E. O’Brien, President and 
Chief Executive Officer of New York 
State Industries for the Disabled hon-
ored for her tireless efforts in creating  
 

see Anniversary on page 38 
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Fifty Years Forward: NYPCC’s Journey of Hope and Healing 

By Elliott Klein, MBA 
Chief Executive Officer 
New York Psychotherapy and  
Counseling Center (NYPCC) 
 
 

R eflecting on the 50th anniver-
sary of the New York Psycho-
therapy and Counseling Center 
(NYPCC) evokes a profound 

sense of pride and gratitude in me. Hav-
ing been an integral part of this organiza-
tion for 40 of those years, with two dec-
ades as CEO, I have been privileged to 
witness and contribute to our evolution 
and impact. Our journey, rooted in a sin-
gle office in Queens, has blossomed into 
a beacon of hope, illuminating paths to 
wellness for countless individuals across 
New York City. 
 

From Humble Beginnings to  
Far-Reaching Impact 

 
Our story began with a simple yet 

powerful conviction: access to quality 
mental health care is a right, not a privi-
lege. This belief has guided every step 
we have taken, from our early days in a 
modest Briarwood, Queens office to our 
expansion across the city’s boroughs. 
Today, our reach extends to over 25,000 
individuals annually through facilities 
that have become synonymous with heal-
ing and hope. 

This growth is not just a measure of our 
success but a reflection of the increasing 
need for compassionate and comprehen-
sive mental health services. Each of our 
centers, now spanning buildings up to 
75,000 square feet, is more than just a 
space for therapy; they are sanctuaries 
where individuals and families can find 
solace, understanding, and pathways to 
recovery. 

Investing in Our Greatest Asset: Our Staff 
 

The backbone of NYPCC’s enduring 
legacy is our dedicated team. Understand-
ing the intrinsic link between caregiver 
well-being and patient care, we have culti-
vated an environment that supports our 
staff’s professional growth and personal 
wellness. Wellness initiatives promoting 
work-life balance, ongoing training and 
development, and mental health aware-
ness ensure that our team is not only 
equipped to provide exceptional care but 
also feels valued and supported. 

The establishment of the NYPCC 
Academy exemplifies our commitment to 
excellence. By offering Continuing Edu-
cation credits and fostering a culture of 
learning, we empower our employees and 
extend our reach beyond our walls, im-
pacting the broader mental health commu-
nity. This focus on education ensures that 
our employees remain at the cutting edge 
of mental health practice, benefitting both 

those we serve and the field at large. 
 
Embracing Diversity, Cultivating Inclusion 
 

NYPCC’s strength lies in our diversity. 
Over 85% of our employees are bilingual 
and bicultural, which enables us to offer 
culturally sensitive treatment, bridging lan-
guage barriers and fostering a deep sense of 
trust with our clients. This approach is not 
just about providing services in multiple 
languages; it is about respecting and under-
standing the cultural nuances that shape 
one’s experience with mental health treat-
ment. This inclusivity is crucial for effective 
care and is a cornerstone of our practice. 
 

Championing Mental Health  
Awareness and Advocacy 

 
Our commitment to mental health ex-

tends beyond individual care. Through 
community outreach and educational pro-
grams, we have taken an active role in 
challenging the stigma that still surrounds 
mental health. Initiatives like our annual 
anti-bullying coalition community fairs 
demonstrate our proactive approach to 
societal issues, showing that our commit-
ment to well-being extends to creating 
safer, more supportive communities. 

These efforts are vital not only for 
changing perceptions but also for advocat-
ing for policies that support mental health 
care accessibility and equity. As we en-
gage with local communities, policymak-
ers, and other stakeholders, we aim to 
build a more informed and compassionate 
society where mental health is prioritized 
and supported. 

 
Reflections on Leadership and Legacy 

 
Leading NYPCC through decades of 

change and challenge has been the honor 

of my lifetime. The landscape of mental 
health care has evolved dramatically dur-
ing this time, influenced by advancements 
in research, changes in public policy, and 
shifts in societal attitudes. Navigating 
these changes has required resilience, 
innovation, and an unwavering commit-
ment to our core values. 

As I reflect on our journey, I am struck 
by the countless stories of transformation 
and healing that have unfolded within our 
centers. These stories are a testament to 
the power of compassionate care and the 
resilience of the human spirit. They in-
spire us to continue our work, pushing 
boundaries and exploring new ways to 
serve our communities. 
 

The Road Ahead:  
NYPCC’s Vision for the Future 

 
Looking to the future, I am filled with 

optimism and resolve. The challenges 
facing mental health care are significant, 
but they are matched by our passion and 
dedication to meeting them head-on. Our 
vision for the next 50 years is bold and 
expansive, driven by the belief that every-
one deserves access to the care and sup-
port they need to thrive. 

This vision includes expanding our ser-
vices to reach even more individuals and 
communities, leveraging technology to 
enhance access and efficacy, and continu-
ing to advocate for systemic changes that 
support mental health wellness. We are 
committed to being at the forefront of 
mental health care, pioneering new ap-
proaches, and building partnerships that 
amplify our impact. 

 
Elliott Klein, MBA, is the CEO of NY-

PCC. He can be contacted at el-
liottklein@nypcc.org or by visiting our 
website at nypcc.org. 

Elliott Klein, MBA 

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
mailto:elliottklein@nypcc.org
mailto:elliottklein@nypcc.org
http://www.nypcc.org
https://nypcc.org/
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Understanding and Addressing Childhood Trauma 

By Jeniffer Cruz, PhD, NCSP 
Psychologist 
Behavior Therapy Associates 
 
 

E veryone experiences scary or 
difficult events in their lives. For 
some children, these events can 
be so frightening or dangerous 

that they can have a lasting impact on 
their well-being. Trauma refers to the 
physical, cognitive, and emotional re-
sponses to an event (or events) that is 
physically or emotionally overwhelming 
or life-threatening. Children’s responses 
to a traumatic event can have negative 
effects if left untreated.  

Trauma can be the result of a single 
incident, like the unexpected death of a 
loved one, a serious accident, or experi-
encing a natural disaster. It can also be 
chronic or ongoing, such as repeated in-
stances of neglect, bullying, and exposure 
to family or community violence. Com-
munities can also experience trauma 
through discrimination and racism that 
can affect future generations. While trau-
ma from a single event can be impactful, 
research tells us that children who experi-
ence a higher number of Adverse Child-
hood Experiences, or ACEs, are more 
likely to have negative consequences that 
continue into adulthood. Early exposure to 
many ACEs can lead to excessive stress 
that can impact brain development. This 
may affect attention and learning and 

make it challenging to form positive rela-
tionships with others. Regarding educa-
tion, the impact of trauma has been asso-
ciated with higher rates of suspension and 
expulsion, higher dropout rates, increased 
referrals for special education, and lower 
academic performance. The long-term 
effects of trauma on physical and mental 
health include increased risk of conditions 
like diabetes, cardiovascular diseases, 
depression, and suicide (Centers for Dis-
ease Control and Prevention, 2019).  

Signs of childhood trauma vary based 

on age and developmental level. For ex-
ample, children who are preschool-aged or 
younger may display a regression of skills 
they previously acquired (e.g., toileting, 
talking), poor eating habits, and sleep dis-
turbances such as nightmares or fears 
around falling asleep. Elementary children 
can present with sleep challenges, difficul-
ties concentrating in school, and retelling 
the event often, while teens may express 
feelings of shame and guilt about the event 
or engage in risky behaviors like drinking 
or using harmful substances. 

If a child has experienced a traumatic 
event, families should find ways to support 
safety and predictability, including return-
ing to previous routines like mealtimes and 
bedtimes. Creating opportunities for ex-
pressing feelings in a safe, supportive envi-
ronment as a family can also be beneficial. 
Caregivers are encouraged to answer chil-
dren’s questions about the event honestly 
while also using words and phrases that 
match the child’s level of understanding. 
Depending upon the event, children may 

have concerns about their own safety or 
the safety of loved ones, and creating an 
explicit plan for safety can help alleviate 
their worries. Engaging in joyful activities 
together, like reading a book or watching a 
movie and discussing character emotions 
or playing games and drawing, can provide 
children space to express themselves in 
multiple ways. Although it may be diffi-
cult, caregivers should continue to set ap-
propriate limits and boundaries, as this 
promotes consistency and predictability in 
the child’s life.  

Caregivers will want to pay attention to 
significant changes in their child’s behav-
ior and seek out additional support from a 
mental health professional if these changes 
are extreme or persist for several weeks. 
Current evidence-based treatments, such 
as Trauma-Focused Cognitive Behavior 
Therapy (TF-CBT), will include compo-
nents to help both children and their care-
givers receive the tools they need to cope 
with the event. Treatment can help chil-
dren and families identify unhelpful 
thoughts, learn skills to help cope with 
thoughts and feelings about the trauma, 
provide parenting strategies, create a plan 
for dealing with trauma reminders, and 
develop a trauma narrative to increase the 
child’s exposure to the trauma in a safe 
and controlled setting. Children will devel-
op the tools they need to prepare them-
selves for a future after trauma.  

Schools can meet the needs of students 
who have experienced trauma. They can 
adopt policies and procedures that empha-
size a positive school climate that will 
promote safety and trust within the school 
community. In fact, practices used to en-
hance school climate and trauma-
informed practices are aligned. Trauma-
informed care incorporates principles of 
safety, peer support, trust and transparen-
cy, collaboration, empowerment and 
choice, and cultural, historical, and gender  
 

see Trauma on page 41 

Adolescent Gambling: A Growing Concern 

By Richard Anemone, MPS, LMHC 
Behavioral Mental Health  
Counseling PLLC 
 
 

A dolescent gambling has turned 
into a difficult issue that can 
have huge negative ramifica-
tions for the individual, family, 

and communities.  
A representative sample of 2,274 US 

residents aged 14–21 participated in a 
random telephone survey. Findings re-
vealed that 68% had engaged in gambling 
in the past year, with 11% doing so more 
than twice per week. The rates of problem 
and pathological gambling were compara-
tively lower than those observed in a prior 
adult survey that employed the same 
questionnaire (Welte et al., 2007). 

Gambling among adolescents can take 
several forms, including access to online 
gambling websites and apps, which offer 
a wide range of options, including casino-

style games, sports betting, and online 
lotteries. These platforms are often easily 
accessible and may not have strong age 
verification measures. Informal gambling 

activities include card games, dice games, 
or betting on sports events among them-
selves or peers. Older friends or family 
members can purchase lottery tickets and 

scratch cards. Social media and gaming 
where users can buy and sell virtual items, 
loot boxes, or engage in other forms of 
simulated gambling. 

Adolescents may engage in gambling 
for various reasons, including the thrill 
and excitement of risk-taking, and the 
potential for winning can be appealing to 
adolescents who seek thrill and novelty. 
Peer pressure and the desire to fit in with 
peers who gamble may contribute to ado-
lescents' involvement in gambling activi-
ties. Some adolescents may turn to gam-
bling as a way to escape boredom, stress, 
or other emotional challenges they are 
facing. A limited understanding of the 
potential consequences and risks associat-
ed with gambling may lead adolescents to 
participate without recognizing the long-
term impact. Exposure to gambling 
through advertisements, movies, or online 
content can normalize the behavior and  
 

see Gambling on page 41 
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Disparities in Pain Management: Examining Cultural Inequities  
 

And the Critical Role of Behavioral Health Providers  

By Crystal Taylor-Dietz, PsyD  
National Director of Behavioral Health 
Services, Devereux Advanced 
Behavioral Health 
 
 

F or decades, pain management 
and the treatment of chronic pain 
(CP) have proven to be a com-
plex, costly, and challenging area 

within the healthcare industry.  
While advancements in best practices 

for treating CP have evolved to include 
multimethod and multidisciplinary team 
approaches that incorporate analgesics, 
physical therapy, psychotherapy, and 
complementary/alternative medicines, 
the traditional unimodal biomedical mod-
el is still apparent and often leads to poor 
outcomes (Edmond, Heapy, Kerns, 
2019). Disparities in socioeconomic sta-
tus, race, sexual orientation, and gender 
further affect access and opportunities for 
marginalized populations to receive the 
most effective treatments (Center for 
Disease Control; Cohen, Vase, Hooten, 
2021). In addition, an individual’s expe-
rience of pain and the implications of 
ineffective treatment are impacted by 
sociocultural factors such as systemic 
discrimination, bias, and cultural stigma 
(NIH Heal Initiative).  

In 2020, the International Association for 
the Study of Pain (IASP) revised its defini-
tion of pain. The new definition states that 
pain is “an unpleasant sensory and emo-
tional experience associated with, or resem-
bling that associated with, actual or poten-
tial tissue damage.” The definition further 
clarifies that pain can be experienced with-
out identifiable evidence of tissue damage.  

Implications on Society 
 

Chronic pain can have significant func-
tional and financial implications for indi-
viduals, families, and society as a whole. 
According to the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC), an analy-
sis of National Health Interview Survey 
data revealed that in 2021, an estimated 

51.6 million people (20.9% of US adults) 
experienced CP, with 17.1 million (6.9% 
of US adults) experiencing high-impact 
CP, which significantly impacts day-to-
day functioning.  

Children also suffer from CP when it is 
not associated with a disease. Although 
research is more limited in this area, and 
prevalence rates vary, a systematic review 
noted 4% to 88% of children and adoles-
cents experienced various areas of pain 
(King et al., 2011), and other research 
showed prevalence rates for a pediatric 
population of 25% (Perquin et al., 2000). 
In addition, COVID-19 has contributed to 
increases in CP cases related to stress 
about the pandemic and long COVID-19 
symptoms (Abramson, 2022).  

In addition to the substantial impact of 
CP on individuals and families, there is a 
considerable financial burden to society 
that results from healthcare costs and loss 
of work productivity. A study conducted 
by the Institute of Medicine’s Committee 
on Advancing Pain Research, Care, and 
Education concluded that the total finan-
cial burden to the US in 2010 ranged from 
$560 billion to $635 billion, which, at that 
time, was “nearly 30% higher than the 
combined cost of cancer and diabetes  
 

see Disparities on page 40 

 

Your Options for Responding to Mental Illness Stigma 
 

 (Protectively, Collaboratively, or Assertively)  
By Dan Berstein, MHS 
Chief Advocacy Officer 
Mindquity 
 
 

I  have been open about my bipolar 
disorder for almost twenty years. 
Immediately after I spoke at my first 
mental health awareness event, I was 

met with feedback and gratitude. People 
thought it was a brave thing for me to 
speak up about my mental illness to fight 
stigma. But the truth is, I felt I had to re-
veal my mental health problems because I 
was scared of being stigmatized. When I 
had my first manic episode, I was at col-
lege and Facebook had just come out. I 
was nervous that people were going to 
gossip about me, and I would never know 
who knew what about my mental health 
history, so I felt I had to take control of 
my own story to stop my anxiety. I want-
ed people to know that they did not have 
leverage over me. Because I was telling 
people myself, anyone who knew about 
my condition would know it was not a 
secret skeleton in my closet.  

After close to two decades of being 
public with my illness, I still am not al-
ways sure when stigma, microaggres-
sions, and discrimination are impacting 
my life. These things are difficult for any-
one to notice because our society is often 
not as sensitive to prejudices and discrim-
ination about mental illness as it is to prej-
udices regarding other conditions and 

diversity groups - and because, like most 
biases, mental illness stigma is often hid-
den, unintentional, and systemic.  

Through my work with the Mental 
Health Safe Project, I have developed 
tools to help people navigate the confu-
sion of the stigma experience. Recently, 
we have created the “Stigma Can Look 
Like” campaign to educate others about 
how mental illness stigma can manifest in 
everyday life and to help people become 
aware when they believe they are experi-
encing stigma and connect them to op-
tions to respond.  

We have shared an image from the cam-
paign at the top of this article. You can 
also visit mhsafe.org/options to learn more. 
 

Five Steps for Responding to  
Stigma (The 5 C’s) 

 
In this article, I will share a 5-step 

framework (the 5 C’s) for deciding how 
to respond when you believe mental 
illness stigma may occur. Then I am 
going to share examples of ways you 
might respond protectively (meaning 
you focus on self-care and may choose 

not to do anything), collaboratively 
(meaning you work to connect with the 
other person to have a learning experi-
ence), and assertively (meaning you take 
action to assert your rights more unilat-
erally because the other person is not 
collaborating). 

Whenever something stigmatizing hap-
pens, we can Clarify what happened in 
case it was a potential misunderstanding, 
Cope with how we feel from the trauma, 
Collect evidence so we have a possible 
way to prove there is a problem, Culti-
vate personal and professional support 
options, and Consider the next step of 
whether we want to act.  

Below is a guide summarizing some 
questions you can ask yourself at each 
stage (tools to help you at each stage are 
available at mhsafe.org/options): 
 

5 Steps for Responding to Stigma 
 
 Clarify what happened (Did this oc-

cur?) 
 
• Is this stigma and/or discrimination? 
 
• Is this unclear? 
 
• What are some other possible expla-

nations? 
 
2. Cope with trauma (How do you feel?) 
 

see Your Options on page 42  

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
https://behavioralhealthnews.org/how-we-as-practitioners-can-foster-stigma/
http://www.mhsafe.org/options
https://mhsafe.org/options/


PAGE 26 BEHAVIORAL HEALTH NEWS ~ SPRING 2024 

Anxiety and Psychosomatic Symptoms in Schools 

By Eve McCoog, LCSW, 
and Sara Battaglia, LSW 
First Children Services 
 
 

P sychosomatic symptoms are the 
physical and physiological expe-
riences caused by mental or emo-
tional conflict or distress. Often, 

they are dismissed as being imagined or 
exaggerated, likely because they are part 
of someone’s internal experience. It is 
important to note psychosomatic symp-
toms are very real for the people experi-
encing them and can have a major impact 
on their ability to function and meet the 
demands of daily life. These psychoso-
matic symptoms are one of the most ef-
fective ways for clinicians to determine 
one’s internal distress. As hormones, like 
adrenaline and cortisol, are released dur-
ing a stress response, our neurological and 
endocrine systems display the effects of 
that stress. 

A simple way to think about these inter-
nal experiences is by comparing them to 
toothpaste inside the tube. No one can see 
the toothpaste until it is expressed, just as 
no one can see our internal experiences 
until they are expressed as words, actions, 
or even pain. Commonly experienced 
psychosomatic symptoms include changes 

in our breathing and/or heart rate, shaki-
ness or trembling, tension in our muscles, 
headaches, backaches, temperature chang-
es such as hot flashes or chills, tingling, 
numbness, shivers, stomachaches, diges-
tive issues, sense of dread, panic, hope-
lessness. 

Often, psychosomatic symptoms expe-
rienced by adolescents are a result of anx-

iety. Anxiety is not always a disorder; 
sometimes, anxiety is a necessary func-
tion that alerts our body to potential dan-
ger. It also may arise when anticipating 
something that may bring us physical or 
emotional discomfort, distress, or harm. 
For children and adolescents in school, 
this can include fear of failure or making 
mistakes on assignments or in front of 

peers. Another source of anxiety may be a 
lack of emotional safety resulting from 
negative past experiences, both at home 
and at school. During adolescence, there 
may be a developmentally appropriate 
lack of self-confidence, which can morph 
into a source of anxiety as it leads to neg-
ative self-talk and increased belief in neg-
ative outcomes. Students who lack effec-
tive self-regulation skills may experience 
higher anxiety due to an inability to self-
soothe. Finally, poor sleep, hygiene, eat-
ing, and other poor self-care habits im-
pede our adolescent’s ability to regulate, 
process, and manage their worlds, leading 
to mental and emotional distress. 

A major factor contributing to the in-
crease in psychosomatic symptoms, par-
ticularly in adolescents, is the effect of the 
coronavirus pandemic beginning in 2020. 
Experts are only beginning to study the 
effects of the pandemic but already see a 
significant increase in the frequencies of 
psychosomatic symptoms and negative 
emotions especially in younger people. 
Uncertainty is a huge component of anxi-
ety. That, coupled with things like the fear 
of infection and the measures taken to 
stop the spread of the virus, add to the 
likelihood of emotional distress.  
 

see Schools on page 32 

Crisis from page 14 
 
suppressed the presence of fear. His 
emotional landscape manifested as intol-
erable physical pain, presenting as a cy-
clical crisis, impairing healthy function-
ing, and increasing the use of medica-
tions to self-soothe. 

As EG continued to maneuver through 
the complexities of the therapeutic rela-
tionship, the introduction of arts-based 
interventions focused on his propensity 
to use his hands, as he is a self-identified 
tinker (a person who travels from place 
to place mending metal utensils as a way 
of making a living) and electrician by 
trade. Structured arts-based directives 
created space for exploration of the not-
ed emotional content, which was previ-
ously too uncomfortable to examine. In 
conjunction, mindfulness-based stress 
reduction tools re-grounded EG, and 
outbursts decreased due to strategies in 
place to appropriately direct and hold 
feelings of anger and agitation. EG’s 
preoccupation with pain shifted to a fo-
cus on writing, meditation, and visual 
arts, which strengthened a more positive 
sense of self. EG felt safe in this alliance 
through the direct confrontation of mis-
directed anger, persistence in tolerating 
the discomfort with the intimacy re-
quired to maintain a therapeutic relation-
ship, and a willingness to confront his 
fear and sadness.  

Back spasms continued intermittently, 
yet the intensity of chronic pain dimin-
ished, and exploration of medical inter-
ventions resumed. EG invited vulnerabil-
ity, so when pain emerged during the ses-
sion, he ceased to lash out and instead 
allowed himself to be held by compas-
sion. EG’s chronic pain was no longer 
prominent as it retreated, which allowed 

the re-emergence of EG as a tinker, Artist, 
and in relationship with providers. EG’s 
treatment is in accordance with S:US’ 
philosophy of care, “When an individual’s 
life is put on hold for circumstances 
unique to them, establishing a relationship 
with them is step one. It’s our guide to the 
services we provide. We don’t empower 
people. We give people the tools to em-
power themselves.” By understanding the 
contextual components of chronic pain, 
individuals like EG rediscover their own 
unique potential and strength-based skills 
to flourish. 

If we treat chronic pain to uncover 
emotional pain, we create pathways to 
connection with self and others. While 
addressing the complex interplay be-
tween mental health, chronic pain, and 
its comorbidities, providers must pay 
regard to the unique needs and circum-
stances of everyone to develop personal-
ized treatment. This may involve medi-
cal interventions, psychological support, 

lifestyle modifications, and social ser-
vices to optimize outcomes and improve 
overall well-being.   

 
Issy Francis, BSN, RN, is Director of 

Nursing and Dani York, LCAT, RDT, is 
Director of Clinical Support & Enhance-
ment at Services at Services for the Un-
derServed (S:US).  

To learn more about Services for the 
Underserved’s approaches to care, visit 
sus.org, call 212-633-6900, or email 
info@sus.org. 
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Breaking Mental Health Stigma in the NYC Hispanic/Latino Community 

By NAMI-NYC 
 
 

A t NAMI-NYC, we often say 1 
in 5 of us is affected by mental 
illness, and the other 4 are 
family, friends, neighbors, and 

colleagues. We are ALL impacted by 
mental illness. Most interventions are for 
the individual, but it's critically important 
to remember the first ring around the per-
son – their friends and family.  

NAMI-NYC is the only non-profit of-
fering free mental health programs and 
support directly to family members caring 
for a loved one with mental health chal-
lenges. Together, we offer peer-led, peer-
run classes, 40 support, and social groups, 
a Helpline in 180 languages, family men-
toring, and more to help New Yorkers 
with mental illness - and their families - 
on the road to recovery. 

At NAMI-NYC, we also focus on 
breaking the stigma, especially in under-
served communities. Due to our unique 
position to assist families, we wanted 
family support to shine in our PSA video 
for Hispanic/Latino New Yorkers. The 

Hispanic/Latino community specifically 
faces significant stigma surrounding 
mental illness, as well as challenges ac-
cessing care. Language barriers and the 
lack of bilingual practitioners are just a 
few of the reasons many Hispanics/
Latinos are left without the support they 
need. In addition, the COVID-19 pan-

demic has disproportionately impacted 
this community.  

Despite these challenges, NAMI-NYC 
has made efforts to address stigma and 
improve access to care through its Span-
ish language programs and this campaign. 
At NAMI-NYC, it's more than offering 
translation and interpretation, but devel-

oping customized culturally responsive 
programs, led and run by volunteers, and 
in this case, community members who 
identify as Hispanic/Latino.  

The success of the PSA project is also 
largely attributed to thorough research 
and community engagement. Through 
extensive field studies, NAMI-NYC 
gained valuable insights into the attitudes 
and needs of the Hispanic/Latino commu-
nity regarding mental health. This re-
search guided the development of the 
PSA video and informed the organiza-
tion's outreach and distribution strategy. 
We conducted the interviews in English 
and Spanish on the streets of New York 
City. These interviews were audio record-
ed, and then we organized the data by 
theme, age, race, and zip code. Some of 
these insights included: 
 
"I don't talk to my family about mental 
health. I don't know if it's a cultural ob-
stacle, but both my parents are immi-
grants, and they never really held that 
kind of space for open dialogue." 
 

see NAMI-NYC on page 39 

Breaking Down Barriers: The STAR Program’s  
 

“Stop Mental Health Stigma” Campaign 
By Michelle Melendez, MS, LCSW, CHC, 
and Jose Iorio 
The STAR Health Center 
 
 

I n an era where mental health discus-
sions are often shrouded in misun-
derstandings and misconceptions, 
the “Stop Mental Health Stigma” 

campaign emerges as a beacon of hope 
and enlightenment. Spearheaded by the 
STAR Program at SUNY Downstate 
Health and Sciences University and gen-
erously funded by the New York State 
Office of Mental Health, this initiative 
seeks to dismantle the barriers of stigma 
surrounding mental health care. Through 
the dedicated efforts of individuals like 
Jose Iorio, a media and marketing consult-
ant for the STAR Program, and Michelle 
Melendez, MS, LCSW, CHC, the Behav-
ioral Health Director at STAR Health 
Center, the campaign is making signifi-
cant strides toward creating a more under-
standing and supportive society. 
 

The Power of Social Media 
in Combatting Stigma 

 
Jose Iorio's insights reveal the pivotal 

role of social media in altering percep-
tions and encouraging open dialogues 

about mental health. By leveraging plat-
forms that reach millions daily, the cam-
paign employs a variety of content for-
mats — from informational posts and 
personal testimonials to roundtable dis-
cussions and interactive quizzes. These 
efforts aim to educate and foster a sense 
of community and inclusivity, indirectly 

touching the lives of those grappling with 
mental health issues. 

Collaborating with organizations like The 
Adolescent Education Program (THEO 
Program) further amplifies the campaign's 
message, extending its reach and impact. 
It's a testament to the power of unity in ad-
dressing complex societal challenges. 

Engaging Content, Engaging Minds 
 

The STOPMentalHealthStigma.com web-
site serves as the campaign's central hub, 
offering a wealth of resources, infor-
mation, and engaging activities designed 
to challenge stigma. Its success is evident 
in the diversity of its users and the depth 
of engagement, as evidenced by the sig-
nificant traffic it has attracted since its 
inception. This engagement provides val-
uable insights into public attitudes to-
wards mental illness and stigma, high-
lighting the widespread need for love, 
support, and understanding. 
 

A Community United 
 

Michelle Melendez shares the cam-
paign's multifaceted approach, which ex-
tends beyond online efforts to include sui-
cide prevention training, Mental Health 
Awareness Month activities, and work-
place mental health strategies. Particularly 
noteworthy is the campaign's focus on 
listening to and incorporating the experi-
ences of high school and early college 
students, especially within African Ameri-
can and Caribbean communities. This 
inclusive strategy ensures that the voices  
 

see STAR Program on page 39 

The STAR Program’s Stigma Reduction Project interviewed  
people with lived experience and mental health service providers.   

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
https://naminycmetro.org/find-support/
https://www.stopmentalhealthstigma.com/
https://www.stopmentalhealthstigma.com/
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Mental Health: Everyone Has It. Every Day.  
 

Breaking the Stigma with ICAN’s Innovative Campaign  

Combating Mental Health Stigma in a Rural Community 

By Yates INSYGHT 
 
 

L ike all communities, stigma 
plays a role in an individual’s 
willingness to access mental 
health treatment and support. To 

combat this, Yates INSYGHT, in partner-
ship with the Yates County Community 
Services Department, chose to promote a 
countywide initiative focused on promot-
ing comfort in talking about mental health 
and wellness and seeking support and 
treatment to reduce stigma around this 
topic. With the support of OMH funds, 
Yates INSYGHT was able to execute var-
ious initiatives, including the placement 
of billboards and a county transportation 
bus wrap with messaging normalizing the 
need to seek treatment for mental health 
and the synonymity of seeking physical 
health treatment. To add to this message, 
Yates INSYGHT distributed postcards to 
all Yates County addresses, encouraging 
normalization of the conversation around 
mental health and the need for support. 
Each postcard contained direct access to 
local and national mental health re-
sources. 225 posters were created and 
distributed countywide, emphasizing the 
message to normalize mental health, per-
son-first, strengths-based, positive lan-

guage, and promote anti-stigmatizing 
techniques, each offering easy access to 
local and national mental health resources 
and supports via a QR code. In addition, 
Yates INSYGHT was able to execute a 
social media campaign with boosted mes-
saging, allowing us to reach an additional 
46,000 individuals in and around Yates 
County. 

Through partnerships with local busi-
nesses and organizations, Yates County 
stigma efforts were able to expand fur-
ther. Yates County supported efforts 
through a tabling display of education on 
mental health prevalence and stigma im-
pact, as well as local resources and sup-
port at our local County Office Building. 
The display became the initial visual for 
any community member or staff entering 
the Office Building for reasons such as 
the Department of Motor Vehicle Needs, 
Public Health, Office for the Aging, Com-
munity Services and C-SPOA, Depart-
ment of Social Services, and Legislative 

meetings. A local ice cream business, 
Seneca Farms, partnered with Yates IN-
SYGHT to develop and promote a mental 
health matters sundae and offered addi-
tional advertising support via their 15k 
social media followers and business bill-
board. Our largest event consisted of a 
countywide celebration on Children’s 
Mental Health Awareness Day in which 
640 t-shirts were distributed and worn 
with the message “Mental Health Mat-
ters,” and individuals chalked the side-
walks with positive, mental health-
affirming messaging. Yates INSYGHT 
was overwhelmed with the number of 
partners and community members willing 
to support this initiative and create a safe 
space for individuals to feel comfortable 
and confident in themselves and seeking 
support as needed. All participants rallied 
to promote their support through social 
media outlets and a universal hashtag to 
reach a larger audience. 

Yates INSYGHT primarily targeted the 

residents of Yates County, including chil-
dren, youth, adults, and families of the 
Migrant Community, Mennonite Commu-
nity, and those individuals of middle to 
high socioeconomic status who may not 
actively seek necessarily mental health 
treatment due to cultural or environmental 
stigmas. Yates INSYGHT also aimed to 
target individuals of the LGBTQ+ com-
munity who may face limited access to 
stigma-free treatment within their com-
munity in our efforts. We had the oppor-
tunity to utilize a wide range of partners 
and individuals in creating our messaging 
and initiatives to ensure we reached our 
desired populations through System of 
Care work and focus groups. Some of 
these partners included our school sys-
tems, faith-based communities, Public 
Health, community clinics, Chamber of 
Commerce, Social Services, and Commu-
nity Services. 

Reflecting on the work completed 
through stigma funds, Yates INSYGHT 
positively impacted many realms of men-
tal health stigma. Our efforts aimed to 
reduce the negative attitudes and shame 
one may feel around talking about and 
seeking treatment for their mental health 
conditions. We were able to transform the 
 

see INSYGHT on page 37 

By Integrated Community Alternatives 
Network (ICAN) 
 
 

I ntegrated Community Alternatives 
Network (ICAN) is an innovative 
human service non-profit providing 
individualized traditional and non-

traditional service and care to the highest-
risk individuals and families with social, 
emotional, mental health, and behavioral 
challenges. ICAN’s team of over 275 staff 
consists of care managers, service coordi-
nators, social workers, support specialists, 
clinical staff, and an extensive Independ-
ent Practice Association (IPA) of 300+ 
providers who work together to provide a 
platform for support, family reunification, 
and preservation to over 2,400 individuals 
and families each day. We serve six coun-
ties in the Mohawk Valley region through 
over 20 programs that assist and empower 
individuals prenatally through end-of-life. 
We have an amazing culture and love the 
work we do. 

Mental health is threaded through each 
of our programs and is top-of-mind for 
every member of our ICAN team. We do 

our best work for the community by em-
powering our staff to take great care of 
themselves and their families so they can 
do this vital work each day. 

We were overjoyed to receive funding 
for the New York State Office of Mental 
Health Stigma Reduction Project, which 
helped us advance our goal of reducing 

the stigma of asking for help. Once 
awarded, our creative team created an 
innovative campaign to engage Mental 
Health Ambassadors to deliver an impact-
ful message to area youth. Unique and 
inclusive outreach and a “let’s make it 
amazing!” approach to creative work are 
where our team shines. 

We chose teenagers and pre-teens as 
our audience. On top of the stresses of 
simply navigating the world at that age, 
our young people are still finding their 
way through a major collective trauma 
and dealing with constant connectedness 
and incessant barrage of social media. 

To make the campaign as successful as 
possible and ensure that we developed a 
message that would resonate with youth, 
we formulated an online survey to gather 
imperative insight from teens. We asked 
them a series of questions about mental 
health: what it means to them if they have 
negative or positive connotations when 
they hear the term, how often they think 
about it, and who they talk to for guidance 
or help. With close to 150 responses, we 
 

see ICAN on page 37 

Naz presenting to a group of students at  
Frankfort-Schuyler Central School District 

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
https://yatesinsyght.org/
https://ican.family/
https://ican.family/
https://ican.family/
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Empowering Communities through  
 

Inclusion and Mental Health Anti-Stigma Efforts  

By Melissa Clark 
VP of Community Impact 
United Way of the Dutchess-Orange 
Region (UWDOR) 
 
 

T hank you so much for including 
me in this project. Thank you to 
the NYS Office of Mental 
Health for their support. We are 

thrilled to present the work we accom-
plished as part of the Stigma Reduction 
Project.  

My name is Melissa Clark, VP of Com-
munity Impact at United Way of the 
Dutchess-Orange Region (UWDOR). 
UWDOR has a long history of Communi-
ty Impact and anti-stigma practices. We 
were founded in 1937 and, working with 
our supporters, “fight for the Health, Edu-
cation and Financial Stability for every 
person in our community.” We provide 
extensive capacity building and resources 
to our hundreds of local nonprofit part-
ners, including funding, volunteers, essen-
tial items, training, food access program-
ming, and a 24/7/365 human services hot-

line. Through our partnerships and pro-
grams, we can help 1 in 4 people in our 
community, over 214,000 people! 

The Stigma Reduction Project had sev-
eral components. We hosted MLK and 

Juneteenth Equity challenges that encom-
pass a variety of diversity, equity, and 
inclusion (DEI) topics related to mental 
health, racial equity, gender equity, 
LGBTQIA+, ageism, and ableism. Each 

day, participants receive a link to an arti-
cle, video, and podcast encouraging them 
to learn and unlearn themes DEI topics. 
The different modes are to accommodate 
different preferred learning methods. 

Additionally, we hosted a Community 
Conversation around Food Insecurity and 
looked at the intersectionality between 
mental health, food access, and other so-
cial determinants of health. Community 
members and service providers attended. 
We also hosted two Nonprofit Profession-
al Development Workshop days focused 
on DEI concepts and mental health stigma 
reduction. Attendees of all components 
were made up of different areas of the 
population, including hard-to-reach popu-
lations, BIPOC folks, and marginalized 
populations. In total, 1,008 people partici-
pated in various Stigma Reduction Project 
activities.  

We are proud of our DEI work. DEI 
work has been our consistent focus, and 
we ensure it is at the top of our minds in 
all of the programming we execute.  
 

see Equity Challenge on page 34 

WeSpeakNYC: A Toolkit for Overcoming  
 

Mental Health Stigma in BIPOC Communities  

By Dana L. Collins, PhD, 
St. Mary’s College of California, 
and Lauren Gonzales, PhD, 
Columbia University Medical Center 
Department of Psychiatry 
 
 

R esearch has consistently demon-
strated that BIPOC (Black, In-
digenous, and People of Color) 
communities experience dispro-

portionately low access and utilization of 
mental health services in the United States. 
The Substance Abuse and Mental Health 
Services Administration (SAMHSA) re-
cently found only one in three Black 
adults with a mental illness receives treat-
ment (SAMHSA, 2022) despite the fact 
they’re more likely than White adults to 
report persistent symptoms of emotional 
distress (CDC, 2021). Recent data also 
shows that 35.1% of Latinx adults with 
mental illness receive treatment each year 
compared to the United States average of 
46.2% (SAMHSA, 2022). Asian Ameri-
cans and Pacific Islanders (AAPI) are the 
least likely of any U.S. group to receive 
mental health treatment; in 2020, only 
20.1% of AAPI adults with a mental ill-
ness accessed treatment (SAMHSA, 
2022). Social and structural factors, such 

as systemic racism, limited availability of 
culturally appropriate mental health care, 
and stigma, have contributed to these dis-
parities in service utilization for BIPOC 
individuals. Thus, our project aimed to 
challenge mental illness stigma in BIPOC 
communities in the NYC area by using a 
community-based participatory approach 
to develop culturally relevant tools. We 
chose a participatory approach because 
we believed it would help ensure that the 
tools felt applicable to the communities 
we created them with and for. In addition, 
participatory approaches differ from tradi-
tional approaches that mental health inter-
vention design and research typically use, 
in which community members have very 
little agency and opportunity to give input 
and make decisions for themselves. Given 
that BIPOC individuals and communities 
have historically and currently experience 
marginalization, which contributes to stig-
ma, sharing power and centering commu-
nity voices felt essential. 

We began our project by initiating part-
nerships with three New York City-based 
mental health organizations, Brooklyn 
Community Services (BCS) in East 
Brooklyn, Services for the Underserved 
(S: U.S.) in East Harlem, and Montefiore 
Medical Center’s Bronx Health Collective 
(BHC) in the South Bronx. We chose 
these organizations based on their pre-
dominately serving BIPOC communities 
and because they were located in different 
boroughs, which we believed would make 
the project relevant to a wide segment of 
New Yorkers. In addition, we chose or-
ganizations based on one of us having 
previously established a relationship with 
them, as we recognized that trust would 
be an essential component to successful 
partnerships. Establishing the partnerships 
involved discussing the projects’ purpose, 
goals, and timeline with the organiza-
tions’ leadership and other stakeholders. 

With the support of each organization’s 
leadership, we held open community dis-

cussions at each location. Two meetings 
happened in person at the organizations, 
and one was held via Zoom. During these 
meetings, we asked community members 
what they thought was important to in-
clude in anti-stigma toolkits developed for 
their communities. Using our grant fund-
ing, we could compensate all community 
members who participated as partners in 
this project. The community meetings 
were a key part of our project’s design, 
given that our goal was to use a participa-
tory approach in which the people and 
communities our toolkit and website were 
meant to benefit had active involvement in 
the project from start to finish. This was 
important to us from a collaboration and 
inclusivity standpoint, but also because we 
know that historically, especially concern-
ing mental health and marginalized com-
munities, policymakers, researchers, and 
clinicians often take from these communi-
ties and do not give back. This exploita-
tion can lead to further mistrust, stigma, 
and reluctance to partner with researchers 
and clinicians in the future. Mental illness 
stigma, especially, is an area where it is 
crucial to involve lived experience to 
avoid perpetuating these power  
 

see WeSpeakNYC on page 36 
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Stories of Stigma in the Healthcare System 

By Melissa Wettengel, NYCPS, MPH 
Chief Executive Officer 
Hands Across Long Island, Inc. (HALI) 
 
 

F or Hands Across Long Island, 
Inc. (HALI), stigma is personal. 
As a peer-run organization, our 
mental health recovery “lived 

expertise” informs our services, which all 
address structural stigma or population-
level disparities experienced by people 
having psychiatric diagnoses and/or a 
disability and experiencing poverty, isola-
tion, and homelessness.  

Another disparity our community faces 
is one life and death. People with certain 
psychiatric diagnoses have an average 
lifespan of 25 years shorter than the gen-
eral population, primarily based on higher 
rates of metabolic, respiratory, and cardio-
vascular disease. (Parks et al., 2006). The 
causal factors are complex, but research 
shows one contributing factor is stigma 
experienced within the healthcare system. 
Troubling experiences occurring in the 

literature range from microaggressions to 
an over-emphasis on “stability” over well-
ness to the potentially life-threatening 

phenomenon of diagnostic overshadow-
ing, where reported physical symptoms 
are incorrectly attributed to a psychiatric 

diagnosis (Melamed et al., 2019). While 
disturbing, there is some good news here: 
stigma is workable. Studies show that 
“contact-based” interventions, or direct 
messaging delivered by people with lived 
experience, are extremely effective at 
ameliorating stigma (Collins et al., 2012; 
Corrigan et al., 2014). 

This was the origin of HALI’s Over-
shadowed: Stories of Stigma in the 
Healthcare System video project, pro-
duced in partnership with award-winning 
documentary filmmaker Lucy Winer 
(Unlocked, Kings Park: Stories from an 
American Mental Institution.) Overshad-
owed started with a series of focus groups 
with 45 people in various settings: SPA 
housing community residences, PROS 
programs, and recovery centers (thanks to 
our partners Options for Community Liv-
ing and the Association for Mental Health 
& Wellness for help with this process.) 
We asked participants about general expe-
riences with medical care and then about  
 

see HALI on page 34 

Overshadowed participants, filmmaker Lucy Winer, and  
HALI staff after “wrapping” on film day #1 

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
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Beyond the Pain from page 1 
 
get parking spots since I do not look 

handicapped.” 
 

Isolation 
 

As interviewees expressed, stigma re-

sults in isolation and a reduced support 

network. All interviewees reported their 

chronic pain as hidden and that they are 

resigning to the pain, enduring living with 

the pain, and reducing their social activi-

ties. They felt unsupported and isolated, 

with one individual mentioning, “I feel 

very lonely during my doctor visits since 

he is pain-free and doesn’t understand 

what it feels like to be in constant pain.”  
Another interviewee shared, “I am so 

tired of hearing, ‘I know what it is like to 

be in pain,’ and then they follow up with, 

‘I hurt my shoulder, and I was in pain for 

four weeks.’ They have no clue what 

chronic pain is like!”  
Others discussed feeling discomfort with 

increasing dependence on others. One in-

terviewee mentioned, “After asking my 

adult son for help shopping, he gave me 

the impression that my pain was not really 

that bad, and I just need to work through 

the pain. Hence, I am reluctant to ask fami-

ly for help; I just work through the pain.” 
Moreover, interviewees mentioned ex-

periencing guilt and social withdrawal 

when asking for help. One stated, “I don’t 

like others expecting too much from me, 

but I also don’t want them to feel sorry for 

me. Weekly, I go for a walk with a friend. 

I walk a lot slower. I know she is frustrat-

ed with not being able to walk faster, but 

if I try to walk faster, she tells me to slow 

down and save my energy.” 
 

Spouses 
 

Eight married participants described the 

frustration their spouses experienced with 

the increased household duties and physi-

cal tasks.  
One interviewee explained the frustra-

tion she and her husband experience with 

caring for the kids. “I wish I could hold 

my kids more and read to them. When my 

husband is playing with them or reading 

to them because I have too much pain, 

my momma heart breaks. I want to be the 

one playing. I know my husband wishes I 

could do more with the kids; he works 

and comes home to kids eager to play.”  
However, the eight participants reflected 

on how understanding their spouses are. 

“My wife always knows when I hurt, or 

my energy has decreased. She is so empa-

thetic but also encourages me to push my-

self a little more when I am in pain.” 
 

Medical Providers 
 

Interviewees reported frequent interac-

tions with medical providers where their 

pain and credibility were questioned. Af-

ter repeatedly telling her primary physi-

cian of constant fatigue, one interviewee 

explained, “My doctor said to eat healthi-

er and exercise more. She implied that 

walking would reduce my pain.”  
Another participant reported, “My doc-

tor thinks I am a drug-seeking patient. He 

does not prescribe enough to last one 

month. I must be stingy with my pain 

meds, so I don’t run out.” 
 

Mental Health Therapists 
 

Interviewees reported varied experienc-

es with mental health providers.  
“Overall, my experience has been hit or 

miss. It is challenging finding a therapist 

who takes me seriously.” 
“I have seen psychiatrists and thera-

pists; half the time they act like I am a 

criminal when I discuss my treatment or 

that I use medicinal marijuana for pain.” 
Other interviewees reported more positive 

experiences. “It was nice to discuss things 

most people don’t care about, or I cannot 

discuss with others without being judged.”  
“Get away from pills and focus on life-

style changes. Are my coping habits 

healthy, and are there ways I can change 

my mindset to help manage my pain? My 

therapist is here for me and can be count-

ed on.” 
“I need a sounding board, someone who 

is an outlet for me to air out my frustra-

tions. I can tell my therapist anything, and 

she did not judge; it was so relieving.” 
 

Rejection 
 

All interviewees compared themselves 

to others, viewing themselves as less than.  
“I feel like I have failed since my body 

is not doing what I want it to do.”  
Another interviewee said, “I am not 

living up to my own expectations, and I 

feel like such a failure. I don’t blame peo-

ple for not wanting to be around me…I 

can’t do anything because of the pain!”  
Another interviewee who is a mom said, 

“No one wants to be around someone who 

is always in pain. I tell my husband he 

sticks around because he must. I hate that 

part of me; my pain hurts myself, my hus-

band, and my kids. No one wants me.”  
An interviewee said, “I am so defective, 

this body. I can only do the bare minimum 

to take care of myself. I feel like I am bro-

ken. Can I get a refund? That is a joke.” 
 

Pets 
 

Eight interviewees own at least one cat 

or dog. The interviewees said their pets 

simulate human relationships.  
“It is interesting how animals are like 

people with their personalities.”  
“Dogs don’t have any judgments about 

you. It is refreshing because humans, even 

when we have good intentions, we judge 

each other.”  
The interviewees reported increased psy-

chological wellness and decreased pain, 

depression, and anxiety. One interviewee 

said, “I know my dog is an animal, but I see 

him as a family member, my best friend.”  
Another interviewee called his dog, 

“My fur baby, and I am a dog parent.”  
All interviewees viewed their pets as 

emotionally supportive and described their 

pet interactions as comforting and support-

ive. One interviewee said, “My two cats 

can sense physical or emotional distress, 

and they jump in my lap to comfort me.”  
Another interviewee explained, “My 

cats look at me in a way like they are say-

ing, I know you hurt today; let me love 

you a little more so you feel better.”  
Another interviewee mentioned they 

take their dog everywhere, “from the gro-

cery store to trips.”  
“My dogs are amazing! I get excited 

coming home and seeing them no matter 

how tired, painful, or aggravated I feel.” 
 

Conclusion 
 

As awareness of psychosocial factors in 

chronic pain increases, so does the need 

for mental health therapists to familiarize 

themselves with chronic pain. Insight into 

the lived experiences of chronic pain suf-

ferers could enable therapists to under-

stand and support clients with chronic 

pain. Given the relative lack of research 

on the lived experiences of individuals 

with chronic pain, further research would 

enhance understanding and training in this 

area, ultimately improving support for 

individuals suffering from chronic pain. 
 

For more information, Heidi Hillman 

can be reached at hhillman@ewu.edu. 
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Schools from page 26 
 

Virtual schooling, masking, and isola-
tion have impacted social and academic 
expectations and functioning. While at-
tempting to prevent the spread of the vi-
rus, we may have also prevented the de-
velopment of healthy coping, social, and 
problem-solving skills that students are 
naturally exposed to during in-person 
learning. Additionally, as children and 
adolescents were forced to cope with the 
loss of learning and the absence of social 
support, some unhealthy coping skills 
became more common. 

Several challenges arise for children and 
adolescents struggling with psychosomatic 
symptoms. One of the most noticeable is 
avoidance or refusal of schoolwork or 
even going to school. Another psychoso-
matic symptom seen often in a school set-
ting is hypo-arousal or “shutting down.” 
This may look like students who are una-
ble or unwilling to make eye contact, ap-
pear withdrawn, refuse to talk or answer 
questions, or refuse to move to another 
room or make necessary transitions. At the 
opposite end of that spectrum, we may 
also see hyperarousal or explosive behav-
ior in response to anxiety. This may look 
like yelling or shouting, throwing objects, 
hitting or kicking self and others, running 
around or even out of the classroom, and 
frequent or uncontrollable crying. Also of 
note, a potentially less noticeable manifes-
tation of school-related stress and psycho-
somatic symptoms is a negative relation-
ship to food or body image along with 
difficulty or refusal to eat in public. 

Through awareness and understanding 
of psychosomatic symptoms and their 
causes, adults can help children and ado-
lescents build resiliency and skills to man-
age stress responses and, in turn, psycho-
somatic symptoms. Cognitive behavioral 
therapy is an evidence-based therapy that 
focuses on the connections between our 
thoughts, emotions, and behaviors. CBT 
encourages examining and restructuring 
unhelpful thinking patterns, particularly 
those commonly associated with psycho-
somatic symptoms, including residual 
impacts of the pandemic. Adults can help 
adolescents identify and challenge nega-
tive self-talk, develop self-efficacy, and 
increase self-esteem through validation. 

There are many school-based interven-
tions for reducing psychosomatic symp-
toms and increasing emotional and aca-
demic functioning. First, providing psy-
choeducation on anxiety and psychoso-
matic symptoms can make it easier to 
manage. Everyone can benefit from in-
creased emotional literacy, which con-
sists of recognizing, identifying, under-
standing, expressing, and tolerating emo-
tions in themselves and others. This is 
essential for self-regulation. Mindfulness 
can be used to regulate and reduce psy-
chosomatic symptoms. Mindfulness can 
be thought of as a technique that involves 
noticing what’s happening in the present 
moment without judgment. Mindfulness 

practice can include relaxed breathing, 
which slows down the nervous system; 
grounding exercises like counting, talk-
ing to an adult, taking a walk, getting a 
drink, listening to music, writing or 
drawing, or doing something funny. 
Mindfulness practice can easily be indi-
vidualized and implemented anywhere. 
Finally, developing a calming corner, 
which is a designated space in the class-
room for dysregulated emotions with 
specific strategies to regulate and soothe, 
may benefit students. 

Through increasing awareness of psy-
chosomatic symptoms, we can reduce 
suffering for our adolescents and imple-
ment skills and strategies to resolve 
their sources. Most importantly, we in-
crease connection and support by ac-
knowledging things we cannot see but 
are still real. 

 
First Children Services is a family-

operated and family-centered organization 
of teachers, therapists, paraprofessionals, 
and support staff working with 80+ school 
districts throughout New Jersey and Penn-
sylvania to provide behavior therapy, 
counseling, and support services, and is in 
network with Medicaid and most major 
insurance companies in NJ and PA. The 
process of integrating mental health ser-
vices with more traditional behavioral 
approaches like ABA is what sets us apart 
and is truly the best for the children and 
their families. We aim to build true contin-
uums of care across all our service lines 
and populations and strive to deliver life-
changing outcomes to exceptional kids. 

Eve McCoog, LCSW Sara Battaglia, LSW 

Advice from page 18 
 
eating and drinking except in great modera-
tion. Personally, I happen to like vegetables, 
and I’ve given up alcohol because it contrib-
utes to gout—a very painful condition from 
which I also suffer from time to time. But I 
also like a good steak rippled with veins of 
fat. And champagne. It’s bad enough to live 
with pain. To deprive ourselves of great 
food and drink—that’s asking a lot. 

Sleeping well? Judging from advertising 
on TV, at least half the people of America 
are searching for something to help them 
sleep. And all of the information sheets 
about chronic pain tell us that pain contrib-
utes to insomnia. We all know that pain is 
worse at night when we are not doing 
something that might distract us from the 
pain. But—snap of the fingers—we’re sup-
posed to change our sleeping habits. No 
more naps. No more TV while lying in bed. 

Use the bed only for sex and sleep. “Sleep 
hygiene”, as it’s known. And no more 
dwelling on my pain while lying sleepless 
in the darkness of my bedroom! Right! 

OK, OK. It’s all good advice, and it is 
undoubtedly worthwhile to work at man-
aging stress, taking care of your body, 
and practicing sleep hygiene. But give 
me a break; this is not easy. And, to say 
it again, I wish the tip givers understood 
better than they seem to that giving good 

advice is easy, but good advice is hard 
to take. 
 

Michael B. Friedman, LMSW, is a re-
tired social worker and mental health 
advocate who continues to advocate for 
improved care for people with cognitive 
and/or behavioral health conditions as a 
volunteer. His writings are available at 
www.michaelbfriedman.com. He can be 

Recovery from page 19 
 
everyone, but all must persevere, striving 
to regain lost ground and progress while 
maintaining an atmosphere of hope.  

* (For those interested in knowing more 
about this case, click here to read the es-
say which we co-authored.  

 
Dr. Perlman is a member of the Board 

of Mental Health News Education, the 
nonprofit organization that publishes Be-
havioral Health News. His memoir, Rear-
view: A Psychiatrist Reflects on Practice 
and Advocacy In a Time of Healthcare 

System Change, was published in 2021. 
He is a past President of the New York 
State Psychiatric Association and past 
Chair of the NYS Mental Health Services 
Council.  

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
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Prescription from page 10 
 
e-and-more-us-adults-have-chronic-pain-
new-study-shows 
 
Newton, B.J., Southall, J.L., Raphael, 
J.H., Ashford, R.L., & LeMarchand, K. 
(2013). A narrative review of the impact 
of disbelief in chronic pain. Pain Manage-

ment Nursing: official journal of the 
American Society of Pain Management 
Nurses, 14(3), 161-171. https://
pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/23972867/ 
 
Reid, S. (2024, February 5). Chronic 
pain and mental health. HelpGuide.org. 
www.helpguide.org/articles/illness-disabi 
lity/chronic-pain-and-mental-health.htm 

Sansone, R.A., & Sansone, L.A. (2012). 
Chronic pain syndromes and borderline 
personality. Innovations in Clinical 
Neuroscience, 9(1), 10-4. https://
pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/22347686/ 
 
Sheehan, L., Nieweglowski, K., & 
Corrigan, P. (2016). The stigma of 
personality disorders. Current Psychi-

atry Reports, 18(1), 11. https://
pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/26780206/ 
 
Vadivelu, N., Kai, A.M., Kodumudi, G., 
Babayan, K., Fontes, M., & Burg, M.M. 
(2017). Pain and psychology – A reciprocal 
relationship. The Ochsner Journal, 17(2), 
173-180. https://www.ochsnerjournal.org/
content/17/2/173 

Life from page 20 
 
those who attempt. Additionally, those 
who attempt are but a fraction of those 
with thoughts of suicide. 

Dent (2020) explored the role of pain in 
Joiner’s theory about the acquired capabil-
ity for suicide. Pain tolerance and fearless-
ness about death can increase the capacity 
for suicide. Joiner’s theories also highlight 
the distinction between those with suicidal 
ideation and those who act upon those 
thoughts. Joiner argues that one must de-
velop an acquired capability for suicide to 
make that step toward action. How does 
chronic pain affect this equation? 

Dent summarized previous research as 
showing those in chronic pain to be less 
pain tolerant and more sensitive to pain. 
This should lessen the risk of suicidal be-
haviors. Dent, however, makes a point that 
lower pain tolerance for those with chronic 
pain may result in greater distress, which 
could increase the risk of suicidality. 

Dent went on to theorize that those with 
a higher level of pain tolerance would 
report lesser amounts of chronic pain and, 
therefore, less distress from chronic pain. 
In other words, the converse of theories of 
suicide capacity may not be the same for 
those experiencing chronic pain. Specifi-
cally, high pain tolerance may lower risk, 
and low pain tolerance heightens risk. 

Van Orden et al. (2010) conceptualized 
the idea that a sense of liability could be a 
key component of suicidal capacity. They 
compared this to thinking that “my death is 

worth more than my life.” Importantly, one 
of the factors they considered in liability 
thinking was distress from physical illness. 

This may be where quality of life comes 
into play. Let’s say we have two individuals 
with chronic pain. One with a high toler-
ance for pain reports lesser pain burden and, 
therefore, a likely better quality of life. Ver-
sus an individual with a low pain threshold 
and a decreased quality of life. The key 
factor of quality of life can explain what 
appears to be a contradiction of Joiner’s 
concept of acquired capacity for suicide. 

To conclude, we must take quality of 
life into consideration in suicide preven-

tion efforts. A key component of quality 
of life is chronic pain. Therefore, as if 
easing the burden of chronic pain were not 
enough, we must address chronic pain as 
if we were addressing suicide prevention. 

 
Thomas Grinley MBA, CMQ/OE, 

CLYB, is Program Planning and Review 
Specialist at the New Hampshire Depart-
ment of Health and Human Services. 
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Insights from page 21 
 
avenues they can explore to bolster resili-
ence and enhance their overall wellbeing. 
I found as I was trying to recover both 
emotionally and physically, some of these 
suggestions helped me:  
 
• Education and Self-awareness stand as 

pivotal starting points. Many in this 
population lack the language to articu-
late their mental and cognitive strug-
gles, despite understanding their physi-
cal condition. Recognizing the intercon-
nection between these facets can em-
power individuals to better navigate 
their condition. 

• Physical Activity and Exercise, though 
daunting, hold promise. Engaging in 
gentle activities like walking, swim-
ming, or yoga can assuage symptoms 
and uplift mood. Gradual escalation, 
overseen by healthcare experts, promis-
es enduring advantages. 

• Social Support emerges as a lifeline. 
Maintaining ties with friends, family, 
and support circles proves vital in pain 
management. Emotional reinforce-
ment, practical aid, and a sense of be-
longing mitigate the psychological 
toll. Isolation, common due to physical 

limitations, is curtailed by nurturing 
relationships. 

• Peer interactions offer invaluable solace 
and understanding, especially for men-
tal health challenges linked to chronic 
pain. When I discovered peer support, it 
was my new hope for recovery and 
drove me to become the executive di-
rector of People USA. The following 
highlights how peer support has served 
me and how we use them at People 

USA to serve individuals on this ardu-
ous journey: 

• Mutual Understanding and Validation: 
Shared experiences foster validation, 
assuaging feelings of isolation. Support 
groups provide a non-judgmental space 
where individuals can express emotions 
freely, finding solace in mutual empathy. 

• Emotional Support: Peers extend empa-
thy and encouragement, alleviating the 
burden of solitary struggles. Knowing 
they are not alone fortifying individu-
als, instilling hope and resilience. 

• Practical Coping Strategies: Support 
groups exchange coping mechanisms, 
offering tools for managing pain and 
mental health. Shared insights empower 
individuals to navigate their path to-
ward healing. 

• Mentorship and Community: Seasoned 
members inspire newcomers, highlight-
ing recovery's feasibility. Participation 
engenders a sense of belonging, combat-
ing the isolation endemic to chronic pain. 

Peers and support groups offer a lifeline 
to individuals grappling with mental 
health issues due to chronic pain. Through 
shared understanding, emotional support, 

practical coping strategies, and a sense of 
belonging, these networks play a vital role 
in fostering resilience, empowerment, and 
healing. By connecting with peers who 
understand their journey, individuals can 
find the strength and support needed to 
navigate the challenges of chronic pain 
with courage and perseverance. 

Chronic pain presents complex chal-
lenges that extend beyond physical dis-
comfort. Cognitive fog, mood disturb-
ances, and disrupted sleep patterns com-
pound the struggle. Moreover, chronic 
pain exacts a toll on loved ones, magnify-
ing emotional strain.  

I still live with chronic pain; however, I 
have been able to improve my quality of 
life by using many coping strategies, in-
cluding constant medical monitoring and 
educating my loved ones. Having support 
is so important and we at People USA 
want people to know that we are here to 
support them. We will continue to offer 
coping mechanisms: education, exercise, 
social support, peer support, practical 
tools, validation, and empowerment. By 
embracing these resources, individuals 
find a sense of belonging that help mini-
mize negative symptoms and fosters hope 
and perseverance in the face of chronic 
pain's unyielding assault on wellbeing. 

 
Steve Miccio is CEO of People USA. 

Steve Miccio 
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Equity Challenge from page 29 
 
We have an internal DEI committee that 
plans and implements our internal pro-
gramming. Each month, we focus on a 
different theme month. For example, Feb-
ruary is Black History Month, March is 
Women’s History Month, and April is 
when we focus on neurodivergence. Com-
mittee members take turns hosting a 
monthly lunch and learning Zoom with 
videos and discussions. This venue is a 
safe space for staff to connect and discuss 
their experiences. Newer team members 
have mentioned that these opportunities 
demonstrate UWDOR’s commitment to 
inclusive practices.  

The DEI Committee researches re-
sources for upcoming equity challenges 
and ensures smooth implementation. Or-
ganizations may borrow any of the vetted 
resources by visiting www.uwdor.org/
socialequitychallenge. I am also happy to 
speak with folks who would like to bring 
a similar program to their organization – 
you can email me at mclark@uwdor.org. 
Additionally, the DEI committee collects 
data to ensure the themes are specific to 
community-level feedback and interest. 
Pre- and post-surveys were completed for 
the different Stigma Reduction Project 
activities. Pre- and post-survey data were 

particularly helpful in determining peo-
ples’ level of learning and suggesting top-
ics for future activities. UWDOR staff 
members also participate in a dozen com-
munity coalitions and collect anecdotal 
data about DEI trends and emerging barri-
ers. Measurement was managed by col-
lecting registration data and tallying com-
munity outreach mechanisms, including 
social media, community listservs, email 
lists, and direct outreach.  

We always want to be cognizant of po-
tential participation barriers, especially for 
hard-to-reach populations. For these partic-
ular activities, that meant ensuring people 
had access to virtual learning, hosting ac-
tivities that could be accessed at all hours 
of the day, and keeping in mind that some 
topics could be potentially uncomfortable 
for people who may have lived experienc-
es related to their particular circumstances.  
 

Best Practices for Program Replication 
 

For organizations that may want to im-
plement similar programs, best practices 
to consider are as follows: 
 
• Make DEI a permanent part of your 

internal and external organizational 
programming - This will build com-
munity and institutional trust and en-

sure your organization is a welcoming 
place for staff and volunteers. 

• Steal/borrow our research (uwdor.org/
socialequitychallenge) - We have col-
lected over 200 high-level, vetted DEI 
resources that may benefit your commu-
nity and internal stakeholders. 

• Utilize several community outreach 
mechanisms - Consider expanding 
your methods to reach potentially mar-
ginalized populations. 

• You already have the resources - lev-
erage them - Consider the resources you 
already have: staff, volunteers, interns, 
and Board Members. What experience 
can they bring to such an initiative? 

• Ensure roles are identified - Consider 
which staff/volunteers can work togeth-
er to successfully roll out DEI program-
ming for your community. 

• Measure for impact - Implement pre 
and post-surveys and other data collec-
tion methods that may strengthen this 
programming. 

• Consider alignment of priorities 
along with funding proposals - Most 

funders seek proposals demonstrating a 
commitment to DEI principles. You are 
showing your equitable and compas-
sionate leadership by going above and 
beyond in this area. 

• Tell your story - Only you can speak to 
the community about the important 
work you do daily to empower your 
community. Likely, you are already 
utilizing many equitable community 
best practices. Make sure your commu-
nity is aware of your great work! 

 
Melissa Clark is Vice President of 

Community Impact at United Way of the 
Dutchess-Orange Region (UWDOR). Visit 
their website at www.uwdor.org. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  

HALI from page 30 
 
the impact – if any – people thought their 
psychiatric diagnosis had on the care they 
had received. We held more formal phone 
interviews for those interested in sharing 
more of their stories. 

By the end of this process, we had spo-
ken to 45 people. We did not set out to 
find stories that “villainized” providers, 
and we are glad to say that many of the 
people we interviewed happily found 
medical providers with whom they had a 
trusted relationship. Other experiences 
shared were less positive: 
 
• “There have been times when I speak 

up, and all [doctors] say is ‘oh, we have 
to increase your meds,’ like my speak-
ing up or being annoyed is a symptom 
of my mental health, not the reality.” 

• “I feel nervous and like they are hurting 
me with all the medicine. Not every-
thing is explained to me.” 

• “I don’t feel comfortable talking about 
[mental health] with my doctor; I feel 
like they judge or don’t get it.” 

• “They treat us with “kid gloves” when 
we have mental illness.” 

• “Just because they haven’t heard of or 
experienced what we are going through 
before doesn’t mean it isn’t real. I feel 
belittled and like they think I am lying.” 

• “[When I have concerns about my 
physical health], I start getting para-
noid. When these issues come up is 
when I start to hear and see things that 
are not supportive.” 

• “When you tell them about your mental 
illness, just like everyone else, they 
don’t understand. He feels like it is im-
possible to hear or see hallucinations. 
He is a great doctor, but he just doesn’t 
understand.” 

• “I don’t want to tell my doctor [about 
my mental health] because she will be 
scared of me.” 

• “It makes me upset when they repeated-
ly ask if I am on drugs or what medica-
tions I am on.” 

Eight participants agreed to share parts 
of their stories on camera. HALI gathered 
with Lucy and her crew (the original 
Kings Park cinematographer, sound engi-
neer, and editor!) at our Recovery Center 
in Central Islip. The resulting videos show 
in equal measure what interviewees de-
scribe as quality care and what they would 
like to see change. 

Our goal was to present the videos to 
medical professionals and assess any dif-
ference in their thinking about the stigma 
people might experience in their care. We 
presented to 3 of Long Island’s Federally 
Qualified Health Centers (FQHCs) that 
provide integrated care in underserved 
areas: Harmony Healthcare and Charles 
Evans Center in Nassau County, and Sun 
River Health in Suffolk. 

Upon watching the videos, audience 
members – with roles ranging from medi-
cal directors to nurses to dentists - engaged 
in a lively dialogue. One professional 

talked about being “moved to tears.” An-
other discussed the challenges of providing 
person-centered care “within a 15-minute 
appointment.” Several mentioned the need 
for “all medical professionals” to experi-
ence Overshadowed, particularly staff in 
emergency depts and especially medical 
students just beginning their careers. 

HALI then had the privilege of present-
ing to medical students at Hofstra Univer-
sity/Zucker Hospital School of Medicine. 
One participant shared how glad he was to 
see the project so early on in his career. 
The Zucker Hillside Director of Under-
graduate Medical Education, Timothy R. 
Kreider, MD, PhD, shared: 

Overshadowed is a powerful workshop 
with compelling videos showing how our 
healthcare system can sometimes poorly 
serve patients who have mental health 
diagnoses. I wish all healthcare profes-
sionals could learn from this moving pro-
ject about how to take better care of some 
of our most vulnerable patients. 

HALI measured the overall effective-
ness of the Overshadowed presentation 
through a short pre- and post-survey for 
the medical professionals asking whether 
and how a patient’s mental health status 
might affect their care experience and the 
professional’s provision of care. After 
presenting the videos to 39 medical pro-
fessionals, we received 38 completed sur-
veys to compare. We were not sure how 
impactful a 45-minute presentation could 
be, but we were surprisingly pleased: 
 
• While there was some uncertainty before-

hand about how a psychiatric diagnosis 
might impact comfort-seeking medical 
care, afterward, everyone agreed. 

• All respondents showed an increased 
awareness of stigma. 

• All participants agreed or strongly 
agreed that hearing the stories in Over-
shadowed helped them better under-
stand how people experience the impact 
of stigma in healthcare. 

• We also saw some increase in medical 
professionals saying they could think of 
examples where focusing on a mental 
health condition resulted in medical issues 
or necessary treatment being overlooked. 

Moving forward, HALI wants to in-
crease the scalability of the Overshadowed 
project by creating a stand-alone short edu-
cational film that is available for down-
load. We are especially interested in in-
creasing our reach to staff at hospitals, 
where diagnostic overshadowing is most 
documented, and to medical students, 
where we have an early opportunity for 
education. HALI is also interested in pro-
ducing additional content that will amplify 
our community’s voice by collecting more 
stories from people who are not engaged in 
care at all, including unsheltered people. 

Hands Across Long Island, Inc. (HALI) 
has provided peer support services since 
1988 and is the largest employer of peer 
professionals on Long Island. We serve 
people with mental health, co-occurring, 
and trauma-related life challenges through 
non-clinical services, including advocacy, 
supportive housing, employment support, 
wellness coaching, and community bridg-
ing from hospitals and prisons. For more 
information, contact support@hali88.org. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  
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Options from page 21 
 
is one of the primary reasons for the opi-

oid epidemic in the USA (Nahin RL, 

Feinberg T, Kapos FP, Terman GW, Esti-

mated Rates of Incident and Persistent 

Chronic Pain Among US Adults, 2019-
2020).  
 

Common Pain Management Practices 
 

Opioids create that much needed numb-

ness to fade the experience of pain. Still, 

with continued use, individuals become 

vulnerable to the practice and may in-

dulge in enjoying the numbness even 

when the pain is non-existent. Hence, 

chronic pain and the way pain manage-

ment occurs do have a significant impact 

on an individual’s decision-making capac-

ity and judgment.  
To look at the progression from pain to 

chronic pain, it is important to understand 

the process regarding physical impact and 

corresponding pain management practic-

es. Chronic pain does not occur overnight 

since the nature of such pain is recurring. 

Chronic pain starts with certain levels of 

mildness and gradually leads to uncon-

trolled pain. Pain that is chronic now like-

ly began as a mild and nagging pain that 

was likely considered to be a temporary 

phase or environmental factor.  
Since over-the-counter (OTC) analge-

sics are readily accessible, a common pain 

management practice is to take this OTC 

medication as needed. Very often, one 

fails to realize that what seems like a one-
time pain management step may often 

lead to an addiction with anticipated and 

repeated use. By nature, when pain oc-

curs, we immediately want to address it 

with medication for quick relief. Unfortu-

nately, due to the narcotics in pain medi-

cation, one can easily get addicted, and 

often, individuals take pain medication in 

anticipation, even when the pain is not 

occurring. Hence, chronic pain creates 

anxiety and fear. The mind is preoccupied 

with pain, and the only solution seems to 

be the pain medication that provides in-

stant relief. 
 
Socio-Emotional Impact of Chronic Pain 

 
A common impact of pain affects mo-

bility and strength. When pain occurs, 

our mobility gets restricted, thus affect-

ing our functioning, skills, confidence, 

and self-esteem. While physically we are 

restricted in ambulating, the impact is 

psychological and emotional. The lack of 

independent functional ability triggers a 

sense of low self-esteem. We initiate 

harvesting negativity about ourselves and 

self-judge our capacity. We interpret and 

anticipate what others would think of us 

due to our lack of functional capacity 

triggered by chronic pain, such as those 

slow walks, the need for support to 

change positions, and the continued re-

minder of the ache. While at night, the 

world around us sleeps in peace, chronic 

pain wakes us up, and then it’s hard to 

fall back to sleep. These impacts of pain 

leave us with self-pity and frustration -– 

emotions that make us unhappy. Such 

involuntary changes in lifestyle develop 

negative thoughts that clutter our minds 

and lead to irritability, intolerance, and 

frustration. Thus, chronic pain is directly 

linked to the manifestation of initial neg-

ative thoughts, finally leading to depres-

sion. Often, pain and depression occur 

together, one being the physical impact 

and the latter being the emotional/mental 

impact. People with chronic pain illus-

trate that, especially for joint pain sup-

port, when they use prolonged metal sup-

portive frames, commonly called braces, 

they observe changes in that part of the 

body. Patients report bruises, permanent 

marks, and even thinning of that body 

part compared to the symmetrical look 

they had before the chronic pain manage-

ment via braces. Thus leading to body 

image issues. 
Young adults with chronic pain share 

being self-conscious to use a cane or other 

devices to support ambulance because they 

are embarrassed to step out in public with a 

mobility device at their age. Chronic pain 

directly attacks the social identity of many. 

Regardless of age, chronic pain leads to a 

clutter of emotions and negative feelings.  
Chronic pain also creates an environ-

ment of helplessness among older adults. 

Patients compare their lives to when they 

had controlled pain, but when the pain 

returns, it creates a state of helplessness. 

They feel life is not worth living. The 

impact is worse for older adults since this 

population presents higher comorbidity 

and lower immune capacity.  
It is important to consider environmen-

tal factors, as well. Social Determinants of 

Health (SDOH) such as socioeconomic 

conditions, food habits and lifestyles, ad-

herence to treatments and medication, self

-awareness, and sociocultural practices 

significantly impact chronic pain manage-

ment and associated psychological out-

comes. Pain management options depend 

on the individual’s economic conditions; 

several private providers may not accept 

Medicaid as primary coverage. Since pain 

impacts movement, job options are heavi-

ly limited for the individual, affecting 

socioeconomic conditions. Lifestyles and 

attitudes towards accessible and afforda-

ble pain management play a key role, too. 

Diet management and food habits play a 

major role in pain medication intake. Peo-

ple may choose self-treatment over pro-

vider suggestions at the initial stages of 

pain management and may seek help 

when the pain intensity gets out of con-

trol. Often, in such conditions, individuals 

need continued caregiving and regular 

pain management. 

Chronic Pain Among Older Adults  
Enrolled in Managed Long-Term 

Care (MLTC) Services 
 

As a healthcare professional in Care 

Management, the author is experienced in 

working with older adults from diverse 

backgrounds dealing with chronic pain. 

Community members, especially older 

adults who are enrolled in Managed Long 

Term Care services, always have a chronic 

pain-related goal and intervention as a 

requirement in their annual Care Plan. The 

approaches to treating chronic pain vary 

based on culture and attitudes towards life. 

Often, older adults accept chronic pain as 

an associated change in the body about 

age, while others try to fight it out so that 

they may remain independent as long as 

possible. There have been many in the 

spectrum of chronic pain who experience 

a lot of self-esteem issues due to pain and 

find it extremely difficult to cope with the 

pain. Most of the older adults with chronic 

pain need Long Term Care services since 

they require assistance with their activities 

of daily living. Most of the seniors seeking 

help develop chronic pain due to various 

arthritis diagnoses, post-fall effects, age-
related changes in the body, bone health, 

and variations in activities. Of course, 

seasonal triggers and pain as an associated 

health condition hold equal importance. 

While chronic pain triggers anxiety, it is 

also a leading cause of mood swings 

among this older population. Due to pain, 

people forego social gatherings and im-

pose isolation, thus leading to self-
imposed loneliness and depression. Often, 

people with uncontrolled chronic pain 

have expressed the lack of worth they feel 

about themselves and how they have given 

up on any pain management options. 
Living with pain becomes acceptable to 

many seniors since they believe their age is 

to be blamed for persistent health issues 

and chronic pain. A significant number of 

seniors in various communities teach them-

selves to come to terms with chronic pain. 

Seniors think that due to their associated 

health issues, pain management is limited 

and ineffective. For instance, an older adult 

might not accept a knee replacement as a 

remedy for chronic knee joint pain and 

accept tolerating the pain intensity. Seniors 

may stop physical therapy at another level 

because they fail to experience the change 

that occurs slowly. In addition, many com-

munity members who forego recommend-

ed pain management treatments refer to a 

friend or a relative who reported a treat-

ment ineffective. In such cases, patients 

even refuse to go for a second opinion, 

voluntarily confirming their recommended 

treatment to be ineffective. 
As a seasoned care manager in an MLTC 

program, the author recalls adding pain 

management interventions to all patient-
centered care plans to ensure pain manage-

ment education for all enrollees. In MLTC, 

the goal is to help the MLTC program mem-

bers embrace a better lifestyle with accessi-

ble and appropriate pain management op-

tions. To help older adults stay away from 

getting addicted to pain medication narcot-

ics, they are provided monthly education on 

topical pain management options, and Phys-

ical Therapy (PT) is encouraged as a pain 

management technique. Daily short walks 

and simple exercises are encouraged to 

maintain a positive mood while managing 

pain, and proper diet and identifying pain 

triggers are taught. Yet a significant number 

of older adults enrolled in MLTC services 

live with moderate to severe pain intensities 

due to comorbidities and age. Self-care of 

these members and their caregivers is man-

datory to address chronic pain and its impact 

on behavioral health. 
 

Summary 
 

Pain is a physical experience that leaves 

traumatic experiences. Chronic pain is living 

that trauma regularly. While being present 

physically, pain can control mood and one’s 

entire socio-emotional behavior. Chronic 

pain impacts our physical and mental health 

and ruins our self-care process. It makes 

people anxious, stressed, embarrassed, iso-

lated, and lonely to the extent that people 

often fall prey to overdosage of pain medica-

tion, even leading to narcotics addiction.  
Chronic pain can control people’s lives, 

social skills, and willingness to engage in 

activities. Often, people train themselves to 

be numb to their pain if it is tolerable to 

avoid judgment. People suffering from 

chronic pain actively avoid disclosing the 

condition for fear of losing their jobs, lead-

ing to financial crisis, anticipating that they 

may be judged incapable of their profes-

sional role. This constant fear often creates 

burnout, leading to significant depressive 

symptoms that need to be treated on time.  
 

Conclusion 
 

Chronic pain has a direct connection to 

depression. Chronic pain and depression 

supplement each other and easily get en-

hanced if left untreated. Consulting with 

professionals and relaying the symptoms 

to relevant providers on time may help in 

breaking the cycle of repetitive pain and 

hammering down the link between chron-

ic pain and depression. People benefit 

from appropriate education and access to 

treatments and therapies to address both 

symptoms. Insurance coverage also plays 

a key role in the administration of effec-

tive treatment. Hence, adequate room 

should be provided to the person with 

chronic pain to explore experimental 

treatment options for pain management by 

insurance plans. On the other hand, pri-

vate providers should consider contracting 

with insurance plans that provide cover-

age to significantly low-income group 

patients since chronic pain does not 

choose its prey based on economic status.  
Older adults mostly report chronic pain, 

but in truth, it is not an age-related issue. 

Hence, one with chronic pain is not aging 

ahead of time and should not self-
victimize by ageism. Believing that 

chronic pain occurs in a certain communi-

ty or due to a particular health condition 

only is not true either. Chronic pain is not 

a topic of medical racism. A significant 

physical health concern creates equally 

strong mental health impacts. Chronic 

pain and depression can be seen as the 

two faces of the same coin. With proper 

information and education, timely identi-

fication and treatment, and affordable and 

accessible treatment, the condition can be 

effectively treated, and its associated de-

pressive syndrome can be avoided. 
 
Veera Mookerjee, PhD, LMSW, is 

Founder/Director of Resolveera. 

Veera Mookerjee, PhD, LMSW 
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WeSpeakNYC from page 29 
 
imbalances and exacerbating the problem. 

After these meetings, we compiled and 
analyzed the notes and used the common 
themes to guide the toolkit and website 
development. For example, following 
several community members’ advisement 
that the website and toolkit include infor-
mation about inpatient and outpatient 
treatment rights, we included information 
on how patients can learn about their 
rights. Similarly, several members sug-
gested we include information about non-
clinical ways to address mental health, 
such as art, and in response, we compiled 
a list of relevant resources. Most of what 
the community members shared related to 
self and public stigma, so these became 
our primary focus. This was in line with 
our goal of sharing information about 
mental health stigma and challenging mis-
information and misconceptions. Much of 
the website and toolkit are devoted to 
sharing foundational information about 
what mental health is and why it’s im-
portant, why stigma happens, why it hap-
pens in BIPOC communities, and how we 
can fight stigma. Thus, the website and 
toolkit have the potential to help those 
who have some familiarity with mental 
health, mental health stigma, and want to 
care for their mental health, as well as 
those who have less knowledge about 
mental health. To highlight the communi-
ty-based participatory nature of the pro-
ject, we named the toolkit and website 
WeSpeakNYC. When the content was 
complete, we translated it into Spanish to 
make it accessible to individuals who pre-

fer materials in Spanish. We next hired a 
website developer and graphic designer to 
format the content. Our original plan had 
been to work with individuals who have 
lived experience with mental illness. To 
find designers, we recruited directly from 
the organizations we’d partnered with and 
also contacted NAMI (National Alliance 
on Mental Illness) New York and col-
leagues who work to address mental ill-
ness. To move the project forward within 
the agreed-upon timeline, we ultimately 
hired designers without lived experience. 

 Once the toolkit and website creation 
neared completion, we met with each of 
our community partners to plan communi-
ty showcases. These showcases were in-
tended to officially distribute the tools and 
celebrate and honor our community part-
ners’ work. In addition, the showcases 
were an opportunity to hear stories from 
community members with lived experi-
ence. Sharing and hearing these stories 
was another way to center community 
voice and a powerful means of chal-
lenging stigma. Of note, the website is 
still up and running as of this article’s 
writing, and anyone may access it at 
www.wespeaknyc.org. 

With the project completed, we have 
reflected on our work, particularly what 
worked well and what could have been 
done differently. We hope that other agen-
cies interested in doing anti-stigma work, 
particularly using a collaborative ap-
proach, might consider our reflections. 
When partnering with community organi-
zations, it’s important to be mindful of 
their constraints because they often have 
limited time and other resources to devote 

to new initiatives. We recommend ongo-
ing open and honest discussions about 
who can contribute what and being open 
to revising plans as needed. This may be 
particularly true regarding timelines, col-
laborating to set realistic timelines is criti-
cal, and for many tasks, it’s helpful to allot 
more time for completion than you might 
initially think is necessary. While we 
worked closely with our community part-
ners once we began the projects, we devel-
oped the initial proposal independently. 
This was due to timing and other logistical 
constraints, but we recognize that develop-
ing the proposal would have been ideal. 
Co-authoring the proposal and collabora-
tively making decisions about the project’s 
direction can lead to outcomes that feel 
more relevant to the community, com-
municates clearly to community partners 
that their input is indeed valued, and can 
help to increase buy-in and commitment. 

 
Dr. Collins is the Director of Counsel-

ing and Psychological Services at St. 
Mary’s College of California. She pro-
vides direction for clinical services for the 
student population, outreach to raise 
awareness about and address mental 
health, consultation, and training for the 
wider campus community. Before relocat-
ing to her home state of California and 
while the project was ongoing, she 
worked at Montefiore Medical Center in 
the Bronx, NY, where she was a faculty 
member in the Department of Family and 
Social Medicine. There, she provided fam-
ily medicine residents with education on 
addressing the psychosocial components 
of health. 

Dr. Gonzales is a faculty member at 
Columbia University Medical Center’s 
Psychiatry Department in NYC. She con-
ducts research and training through the 
Division of Behavioral Health Services 
and Policy Research. She provides clini-
cal services and training at the Lieber 
Recovery Clinic to individuals with seri-
ous mental illnesses. Her research focus 
is on stigma and social determinants of 
mental health. Across her roles, the 
broader mission is to improve mental 
health services for individuals with SMI 
via a focus on systemic correlates of men-
tal health and recovery-oriented care. 

We express our ongoing gratitude to 
our community partners, Brooklyn Com-
munity Services, Services for the Under-
served, and the Bronx Health Leaders of 
Montefiore Medical Center’s Bronx 
Health Collective. Your investment of 
time, energy, and wisdom made a differ-
ence in challenging mental illness stigma 
in NYC’s BIPOC communities. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  
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ICAN from page 28 
 
had the start of a road map for our cam-
paign. Just over 40% of respondents think 
about their mental health every day, and 
22% think about it many times a week. 

As we started to craft the campaign slo-
gan, there was a lot of creative thinking, 
along with consulting our team of ICAN 
mental health professionals and researching 
nationwide mental health campaigns and 
messaging. There were also a lot of simple, 
straightforward conversations among our 
team, their friends, and colleagues on par-
enting, mentoring, and working with our 
clients. What do we say to our kids? How 
do we guide those we serve? What were 
some first-hand lessons learned? We want-
ed to develop a strong slogan that could be 
worked into everyday conversation, that 
would be memorable, and that would truly 
do the work of reducing stigma by posi-
tioning mental health as something as im-
portant as physical health. Our Director of 
Clinical Services is famous for saying, 
“Everyone has mental health!” and our 
survey showed us that for many teens, it’s 
on their minds every day. The campaign 
slogan emerged triumphantly: 
 

“Mental Health: Everyone Has It.  
Every Day.” 

 
We proposed the slogan to the key 

stakeholders on the project, got the green 
light, and it was time to bring it to life. 

Mental Health Ambassadors were key to 
the campaign’s success and building the 
message through many avenues. We identi-
fied individuals in our community who WE 
knew focused on mental health but who 
youth might be surprised to hear from speak-
ing about it publicly. Those we approached 
to participate in have diverse interests, skills, 
and strong platforms to share their stories.  

The three who worked with us are: 
 
 Liz Ellis, Morning Show Host on KISS 

FM and Promotions Director at Roser 
Communications 

 Al Marro, Youth Care Coordinator at 
ICAN and Professional Mixed Martial 
Arts Fighter 

 Naz Deloach, Artist, Producer, and 
Owner of Dreamer Studio. (Through 
participating in this campaign, Naz 
started working with ICAN as a Facili-
tation Specialist in fall 2023!) 

The Ambassadors didn’t know each 
other coming into the campaign, so we had 
to provide a space for them to meet each 
other, tell their stories to each other and 
our creative team, and build rapport before 
diving into promoting the campaign. They 
each had a relatable “hook” to their mental 
health journey that became the foundation 
for their stories. We focused on the pivotal 
moments they had in realizing that they 
needed to own their mental health – 
monitor it, manage it, and move through it, 
sometimes literally day by day. 

We also used that time together to run 
the campaign slogan by them and to get 
feedback and buy-in. After all, they had to 
deliver it and live it! 

We began with a photo shoot to have 
professional imagery to use throughout 
the marketing pieces we needed. Then we 
set up a Content Day at Liz’s studio to 
conduct pre-recorded interviews and radio 
spots to air on multiple stations. Our mar-
keting team created all campaign materi-
als in-house – graphic design, scriptwrit-
ing, photography, video shooting and edit-
ing, email marketing, and social media 
management. We had a series of posters 
put up in elevators and public spaces. 

Small autograph cards accompanied the 
Ambassadors to visits and they signed 
them for students. On the back was their 
message and the number to the Suicide 
Prevention Hotline. We ordered stickers, 
buttons with the slogan, and t-shirts. 

One of our favorite pieces created was a 
fillable handout for students prompting 
them to reflect or answer based on the Am-
bassador’s “catchphrases” from their sto-
ries: “Find it. Do it. Every day.” and “Find 
your people.” and “Be sure to reach back to 
help others.” It provided actionable items 
that young people could do right away. 

We worked closely with ICAN’s Com-
munity Education and Training program to 
invite Ambassadors into already-scheduled 
school training. Al and Naz worked with 
225 middle and high school students in one 
visit, and all three Ambassadors hosted a 
group at KISS FM, where Liz could give 
them a tour and talk about her work on the 
popular local radio station. All three Am-
bassadors continue to be very involved in 
our ongoing programming in organic 
ways, from work as employees to presenta-
tions to collaborating non-profit partners. 

We heavily leaned on our social media 
platforms, and our posts were amplified 
by our Ambassadors, reaching tens of 
thousands during the campaign. Messag-
ing went out through our email marketing 
to thousands of individuals, videos were 
posted on YouTube, and we crafted indi-
vidual Ambassadors spotlights on our 
website. Their stories were perfect to use, 
expand, and use snippets as needed across 
many platforms in different formats. 

We gathered quantitative results for the 
campaign through expected, traditional 
ways: social media reach, email opens, 
views on videos, number of handouts, 
stickers, and buttons given out, and number 
of students reached through programming. 
We also stayed in touch with the Ambassa-

dors and garnered qualitative feedback 
from them – students and teachers reaching 
out to them, Liz’s listeners commenting to 
her on mental health, a spike in Naz’s mu-
sic streams, and perhaps most importantly, 
their continuance of working their messag-
es into their everyday work. We hope that 
teens will always remember our Ambassa-
dors’ school visits and that the slogan 
meant something to them. 

We continue to hear ICAN staff use the 
slogan in passing at work and embedding 
it into work with their clients. What start-
ed out to be a campaign with the intent of 
having an “every day voice” has indeed 
begun to permeate every day conversa-
tions. Staff who table at various communi-
ty events and job fairs take materials with 
them and continue to spread the message. 

A campaign like this will shine with 
additional time, applications, exposure, 
frequency, platform expansion, new Am-
bassadors, and more! There’s lots of crea-
tive exploration to dive into and a lot of 
momentum from this first run. The impact 
can be monumental for our youth as we 
continue to foster the message that mental 
health is important and something we live 
with and manage. Every. Day. 

Campaigns take time. Movements and 
mindset change take even more time. For 
anyone working in this space alongside us, 
be patient with yourselves, your creativity, 
and your audience. They need to hear the 
message many times and then make an 
internal behavioral decision to adopt it into 
their lives. There has been a lot of stigma 
built up surrounding mental health over 
decades. It will take us all working togeth-
er to lift each other over these barriers. 

 
This project was funded by the New 

York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  

INSYGHT from page 28 
 
way our community views individuals 
with mental illness and encourage a 
framework of community support for 
those needing help. Lastly, our efforts 
aimed to emphasize the prevalence and 
normalization of mental health across 
our many organizations and local busi-
nesses, creating a safer, supportive space 
for those daily. Early focus group work 
and research showed us that most indi-
viduals, youth and adults, enrolled in 
our two primary outpatient behavioral 
health clinics were Medicaid Eligible 
individuals, meaning of a lower socioec-
onomic status. Through our efforts, we 
aimed to see an increase in the number 
of individuals reaching out and engaging 
in mental health treatment and the num-
ber of individuals covered under com-
mercial insurance options. While this 
data has not yet been shared, we look 
forward to reviewing these results. Be-
cause of our ability to reach a larger 

number of Yates County individuals 
through boosting and advertising, Yates 
INSYGHT and our C-SPOA were able 
to see an increase in the number of indi-
viduals engaging one-on-one through 
our social media and website for assis-
tance in engaging with mental health 
treatment and/or support both clinical 
and community-based. 

Yates INSYGHT felt we successfully 
increased conversations around mental 
health and comfortability in talking about 
mental health across Yates County. To 
this day, we still see this unfold. Commu-
nity members continue to wear “mental 
health matters” t-shirts, and many posters 
distributed continue to be displayed 
countywide. In addition, Yates INSYGHT 
has seen an increase in the number of or-
ganizations and local businesses reaching 
out to coordinate and attend mental health
-promoting gatekeeper training, with 
many taking place in the past year and 
scheduled in months to come. Yates IN-
SYGHT has also gained additional part-

ners attending and contributing to our 
ongoing mental health awareness and 
stigma reduction subcommittee that meets 
monthly and identifies ways to continue 
the work started in this initiative. 

In reflecting on our successes and chal-
lenges in executing our mental health 
stigma initiative, Yates INSYGHT felt it 
important to share a few recommenda-
tions for other counties or coalitions aim-
ing to address and combat mental health 
stigma. First, the work makes a differ-
ence no matter how big or small the ef-
fort is! Don’t underestimate the ability of 
a community to unite and work together 
to execute project goals; don’t be afraid 
to engage with and involve local busi-
nesses and organizations outside the reg-
ular behavioral health field. These part-
ners will play a vital role in expanding 
efforts and messaging outside the field of 
local behavioral health and offer the abil-
ity to grow social networks and support 
for those who may be struggling or in 
need. Lastly, stigma efforts and mental 

health promotion should not cease with 
the end of the grant or funding opportuni-
ty; rather, the funds should be used to 
help lay the groundwork for future, con-
tinuing efforts! 

 
Yates INSYGHT represents the System of 

Care for Yates County, a spectrum of com-
munity-based services and supports dedi-
cated to overcoming challenges and meet-
ing the needs of children and youth at risk 
of or experiencing serious emotional dis-
turbance and their families. Yates County, 
being a small, rural community, has made 
great efforts to support its individuals in 
achieving collective wellness and had the 
opportunity to collaborate with the Office 
of Mental Health (OMH) in support of this 
through funds aimed at promoting mental 
health awareness and reducing stigma 
across a variety of realms. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  

HALI from page 34 
 
contact-based stigma change: A cross-
validation. Psychiatric Rehabilitation 
Journal, 37(1), 62-64 
 
Melamed, O. C., Fernando, I., Soklaridis, S., 
Hahn, M. K., LeMessurier, K. W., & Taylor, 
V. H. (2019). Understanding engagement with 
a physical health service: a qualitative study of 

patients with severe mental illness. The Cana-
dian Journal of Psychiatry, 64(12), 872-880. 
 
Parks, J., Svendsen, D., Singer, P., Foti, 
M. E., & Mauer, B. (2006). Morbidity 
and mortality in people with serious men-
tal illness. Alexandria, VA: National As-
sociation of State Mental Health Program 
Directors (NASMHPD) Medical Direc-
tors Council, 25(4), 1-87. 
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Suffering from page 4 
 
those utilizing multiple providers/
pharmacies, and other factors such as his-
tory of overdose or substance use disor-
der. Pharmacist interaction through the 
MAT program also screens for social de-
terminants of health to make appropriate 
referrals to the UPMC Health Plan or 
community resources. 

The UPMC integrated delivery and 
finance system supports the integration of 
comprehensive care. Across the insurance 

services division, UPMC Health Plan and 
Community Care provide access to com-
prehensive physical and behavioral 
healthcare, focusing care collaboration 
and incorporation of appropriate pharma-
cy interventions. The synergy of these 
components promotes the relief of the 
multidimensional suffering associated 
with chronic pain conditions. 

 
Nicole Polashenski, DO, is Associate 

Medical Director of Community Care 
Behavioral Health Organization. 
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Anniversary from page 22 
 
meaningful employment opportunities for 
people with disabilities; Sheryl White-
Scott, MD, FACP, FAAIDD, Senior Med-
ical Advisor at AHRC New York City, 
and a Board of Director of the Human 
Services Research Institute, honored for 
her lifelong commitment to ensuring the 
well-being of patients with intellectual and 
developmental disabilities; Beth Haroules, 
Esq., Senior Staff Attorney and Director 
of Disability Justice Litigation at the 
American Civil Liberties Union of the 
New York Affiliate of ACLU is recog-
nized for her lifelong dedication to de-
fending the rights of people with disabili-
ties; Rebecca A. Seawright, Assembly 
Member for New York’s 76th Assembly 
District, and Chair of the People with Dis-
abilities Committee of the New York State 
Assembly is recognized for her legislative 

work and dedicated advocacy for the 
rights of people with intellectual and de-
velopmental disabilities; Mitchell Bloom-
berg, Chairman-Elect of the AHRC NYC 
Foundation Board, and Co-President of 
International Lights, is honored for over 
30 years of dedicated service on both the 
AHRC NYC Board and Foundation Board 
and for raising millions of dollars to sup-
port AHRC NYC programs; and AHRC 
NYC’s Our Broadway takes center stage 
in the Hall of Honor. This inclusive theat-

rical experience, where performers with 
disabilities collaborate with Broadway 
stars, brings magical moments to life, and 
AHRC NYC recognizes three Broadway 
veterans and performers—Dale Hensley, 
Gavin Creel, and Thayne Jasperson.  

Other honorees will include Sharyn 
Van Reepinghen, the AHRC NYC 
Anne Kraus Award named in memory of 
a formidable AHRC NYC volunteer. 
Sharyn has demonstrated exceptional ded-
ication to AHRC NYC’s mission. And 

Kerri Neifeld, Commissioner of the 
NYS Office for People with Develop-
mental Disabilities, is the Recipient of 
the Leadership in Government Award 
for her exemplary leadership and vision-
ary commitment to enhancing services for 
people with developmental disabilities. 
Errol Louis, New York City journalist 
and host of Inside City Hall on Spectrum 
News NY1, who brings decades of distin-
guished experience in political journalism, 
will serve as the Master of Ceremonies. 
Mr. Louis knows New York better than 
any journalist today, and since AHRC 
NYC is quintessential New York, who 
better to shepherd attendees through the 
evening program? 

Be a part of building a more inclusive 
and empowered community. Support the 
work of the organization. To learn more 
about the event and AHRC NYC’s history, 
click here. 

Cannabis from page 8 
 
chronic pain. One longitudinal study of 
adults newly registered in a medical 
cannabis program with pain who use 
opioids currently underway in New 
York City looks to clarify how the long-
term use of medical cannabis influences 
opioid use (Cunningham, 2020). In addi-
tion to addressing this general question, 
this study will also examine the effects 
of different THC and CBD content and 
routes of administration on a variety of 
pain syndromes. 

In summary, the effects of cannabis on 
pain modulation have heightened interest 
in medical cannabis for the treatment of 
chronic pain. Although the current evi-
dence for its effectiveness has limitations, 
there have been some promising findings. 
Current and future longitudinal studies 
can only help elucidate the role of differ-
ent types of medical cannabis with varia-
ble THC and CBD content and routes of 
administration in the treatment of a wide 
variety of pain syndromes. 

 
Grace Hennessy, MD, is the Associate 

Chief Medical Officer for Addiction Psy-
chiatry at the NYS Office of Addiction 
Services and Supports. 
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Responses from page 16 
 

The Commission added a new require-
ment for acute 24-hour settings, which 
requires the entity to assess pain and treat 
or refer for treatment, which strategies 
may be nonpharmacologic, pharmacolog-
ic, or a combination of approaches. The 
rationale notes: “Pain, especially chronic 
pain, frequently occurs together with 
mental and/or substance use disorders. 
These conditions must be co-managed to 
achieve progress in treatment for the af-
fected individuals. If pain screening sug-
gests a physical pain assessment is indi-
cated for the individual, acute medically 
supervised behavioral health settings 
should assess and respond to physical 
pain by providing or referring the individ-
ual for treatment.” Under this new stand-
ard, acute-care settings that provide 24-
hour care must demonstrate competency 
in assessing, treating, and referring pa-
tients who present with pain. The require-
ment includes management of pain along 
with mental health and substance use dis-
orders, which are often co-occurring. 

The Commission requires practitioners 
working in acute 24-hour settings and 
providing direct care, treatment, or ser-
vices must participate in education and 
training on pain assessment and pain man-
agement consistent with the scope of their 
license. In this case, the rationale states: 
“Psychiatric and behavioral conditions 
have been associated with chronic pain, 
long-term opioid prescription receipt, and 
opioid misuse. Individuals with chronic 
pain generally require extensive biopsy-
chosocial assessment and multidiscipli-
nary treatment. Therefore, to provide 
quality care, practitioners must be knowl-
edgeable about pain assessment, multiple 
modalities of pain treatment, early identi-
fication and prevention of harm from opi-
oid therapy, and adverse health and well-
being outcomes associated with physical 
pain. The organization can increase prac-
titioner competence in pain assessment 
and management by providing access to 
evidence-based educational resources.” 

Additional requirements have been put 
in place on the federal and state levels to 
address training in pain management and 
substance use disorders. For example, 
several years ago, New York imposed on 
prescribers a new training requirement in 
pain management, palliative care, and 
addiction. Once every three years, pre-
scribers must complete at least three hours 
of coursework or training on the follow-
ing topics: New York State and federal 
requirements for prescribing controlled 
substances, pain management, appropriate 
prescribing, managing acute pain, pallia-
tive medicine, prevention, screening and 
signs of addiction, responses to abuse and 
addiction and end of life care. In addition, 
the federal Drug Enforcement Admin-
istration recently imposed a new 8-hour 
training requirement on all DEA-
registered practitioners on the treatment 
and management of patients with opioid 
or other substance use disorders. This one
-time training mandate includes an attesta-
tion of completion as part of a prescriber’s 
next DEA registration renewal. 

Finally, a new Commission requirement 
mandates that healthcare organizations 
facilitate practitioner access to Prescrip-
tion Drug Monitoring Program databases, 
which prevent misuse and diversion of 
prescription medications. Many states 
require that prescribers consult a prescrip-
tion drug monitoring program before pre-
scribing controlled substances for their 
patients. For example, in New York, the 
Internet System for Tracking Over-
Prescribing (I-STOP) law, enacted into 
law in 2013, requires prescribers to con-
sult the Prescription Monitoring Program 
Registry (PMP) before issuing a prescrip-
tion for New York Schedule II, III, and IV 
controlled substances. The PMP, which 
must be consulted at least 24 hours before 
writing a Schedule II-IV prescription, 
provides prescribers with secure access to 
their patients’ prescription histories. Since 
initiating the PMP program in 2013, New 
York has joined more than 30 other states 
in a data-sharing collaborative that per-
mits interstate access to controlled sub-

stance prescription information. Access to 
prescription drug monitoring programs is 
essential to ensuring safe and well-
monitored utilization of controlled medi-
cations that assist in the treatment of men-
tal illnesses, such as benzodiazepines, 
stimulants, and sleep aids. 

The addition of these standards to the 
accreditation and review standards of The 
Joint Commission is an excellent example 
of the commitment of the healthcare sys-
tem to recognize and adequately address 
chronic pain and its impact on behavioral 
health. In conclusion, September is known 
as Pain Awareness Month. The National 
Institute of Neurological Disorders and 
Strokes recognizes this time as “…an op-
portunity to reflect on the needs of mil-
lions of people with chronic pain, as well 
as the research that we hope will better 
prevent and treat it.”12 The 2023 designa-
tion touted promising research underway 
to provide a better understanding of the 
biology of different pain conditions, rec-
ognizing potential pain targets, and testing 
new treatment approaches. Ideally, 
healthcare professionals and care systems 
will work together to address these com-
plex interconnected issues and ensure that 
the highest level of care is provided to 
those in need. 

 
Rachel Fernbach, Esq. is the Executive 

Director and General Counsel of the New 
York State Psychiatric Association and a 
Partner of the firm Moritt Hock & Hamroff 
LLP, where she concentrates her practice 
in the area of not-for-profit law and health 
care law with a specialty in psychiatry and 
other mental health services. 

Jamie Papapetros is Research and Com-
munications Coordinator at New York 
State Psychiatric Association’s Govern-
ment Relations Office, in conjunction with 
Karin Carreau of Carreau Consulting. Mr. 
Papapetros has a decade of experience in 
government relations, identifying, tracking, 
and analyzing pertinent legislation, 
providing legislative and electoral re-
search, memo preparation, and in-depth 
legislative and regulatory reports. 
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STAR Program from page 27 
 
of those most affected by stigma are heard 
and valued, fostering a culture of empathy 
and support. 
 

Looking Forward 
 

The findings from the campaign under-

score the importance of targeted outreach, 
particularly towards younger and male 
audiences who may be less represented 
yet profoundly affected by mental health 
stigma. The demographic data collected 
serves as a crucial guide for future initia-
tives, ensuring that efforts are directed 
where they're needed most. 

As we reflect on the achievements of the 

“Stop Mental Health Stigma” campaign, 
it's clear that the journey towards a stigma-
free society is a collective one. We can all 
contribute to a future where mental health 
is understood, accepted, and supported 
through education, engagement, and empa-
thy. The STAR Program's initiative is not 
just a campaign; it's a movement toward 
hope, healing, and ultimately, change. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  

Michelle Melendez, MS, LCSW, CHC, 
is Behavioral Health Director and Jose 
Iorio is Media and Marketing Consultant 
at the STAR Health Center at SUNY 
Downstate Medical Center. 

NAMI-NYC from page 27 
 
"I don't really talk about my feelings and 
emotions that are the most vulnerable 
with my parents." 
 
"...when I'm feeling something negative, 
something dark inside of me, that's when I 
talk to my psychologist, or I also speak 
with God spiritually."  
 

We were ready to shoot our PSA from 
this programmatic expertise and field re-
search. The narrative unfolds, depicting the 
strained relationship between a mother and 
daughter due to her daughter's mental 
health challenges. The mother realizes she, 
too, needs support to navigate her role as a 
caregiver, parent, and family member. The 

video underscores the crucial need for 
caregivers to prioritize their well-being. 
Family members can't change their loved 
ones. Instead, family members must learn, 
change, and grow in a way that impacts the 
entire family dynamic. At NAMI-NYC, 
with greater knowledge and support, care-
givers are empowered to better understand 
and manage their roles, fostering healthier 
relationships with their loved ones.  

Once the PSA was complete, NAMI-
NYC deployed a comprehensive distribu-
tion strategy. We curated a toolkit for 
community members to share the PSA, 
including email templates, social media 
posts, posters, and more. We utilized or-
ganic channels such as our website land-
ing page, monthly newsletter, standalone 
emails in English and Spanish, as well as 

social media posts. Local media outlets 
aired our PSA, including CUNY TV, 
BRIC, Queens Public Television, Manhat-
tan Neighborhood Network, BronxNet, 
and FY EYE. Our outreach to more than 
25 community organizations serving His-
panic/Latino New Yorkers resulted in a 
deeper partnership with the Brooklyn Pub-
lic Library. Together, we hosted a commu-
nity conversation and in-person focus 
group on the PSA, as well as a mental 
health resource fair at their central branch.  

To measure the impact of our PSA pro-
ject, we hosted three community discus-
sions, including pre- and post-surveys and 
focus groups, two virtually and one in-
person at the Brooklyn Public Library. 
The project's impact exceeded expecta-
tions, significantly reducing mental health 

stigma observed among participants after 
viewing the PSA video. Using our pre-/
post-surveys, we saw a significant in-
crease in the likelihood of seeking help in 
case of a mental health emergency, will-
ingness to speak to others about mental 
health challenges, and openness to con-
necting to a supportive mental health 
community like NAMI-NYC. We also 
saw a dramatic shift in attitudes towards 
people living with mental illness before 
and after the PSA, including acknowledg-
ment of stigma for this group and that 
mental illness could affect anyone.  

For other organizations looking to imple-
ment successful anti-stigma campaigns, we 
recommend conducting thorough research  
 

see NAMI-NYC on page 41 

https://behavioralhealthnews.org/
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.psychiatry.org/news-room/apa-blogs/chronic-pain-and-mental-health-interconnected
https://www.psychiatry.org/news-room/apa-blogs/chronic-pain-and-mental-health-interconnected
https://www.psychiatry.org/news-room/apa-blogs/chronic-pain-and-mental-health-interconnected
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/72/wr/mm7215a1.htm
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/72/wr/mm7215a1.htm
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/pdfs/bsc/BSC_Background_Overview_Progress-GL-Update_6_28_cleared_final_D_Dowell-508-fx.pdf
https://www.hhs.gov/sites/default/files/pmtf-final-report-2019-05-23.pdf
https://www.hhs.gov/sites/default/files/pmtf-final-report-2019-05-23.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/72/wr/mm7215a1.htm#contribAff
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/72/wr/mm7215a1.htm#contribAff
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC5472077/
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC5472077/
https://adaa.org/understanding-anxiety/related-illnesses/other-related-conditions/chronic-pain
https://adaa.org/understanding-anxiety/related-illnesses/other-related-conditions/chronic-pain
https://adaa.org/understanding-anxiety/related-illnesses/other-related-conditions/chronic-pain
https://healthsciences.arizona.edu/news/releases/study-shows-millions-people-live-co-occuring-chronic-pain-and-mental-health-symptoms
https://healthsciences.arizona.edu/news/releases/study-shows-millions-people-live-co-occuring-chronic-pain-and-mental-health-symptoms
https://healthsciences.arizona.edu/news/releases/study-shows-millions-people-live-co-occuring-chronic-pain-and-mental-health-symptoms
https://healthsciences.arizona.edu/news/releases/study-shows-millions-people-live-co-occuring-chronic-pain-and-mental-health-symptoms
https://www.mhanational.org/mental-health-america-reports-strong-connection-between-chronic-pain-and-untreated-mental-health
https://www.mhanational.org/mental-health-america-reports-strong-connection-between-chronic-pain-and-untreated-mental-health
https://www.mhanational.org/mental-health-america-reports-strong-connection-between-chronic-pain-and-untreated-mental-health
https://www.mhanational.org/mental-health-america-reports-strong-connection-between-chronic-pain-and-untreated-mental-health
https://www.hhs.gov/sites/default/files/pmtf-final-report-2019-05-23.pdf
https://www.hhs.gov/sites/default/files/pmtf-final-report-2019-05-23.pdf
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://www.ninds.nih.gov/news-events/directors-messages/all-directors-messages/september-pain-awareness-month-we-are-all-together#:~:text=Each%20September%2C%20Pain%20Awareness%20month,better%20prevent%20and%20treat%20it.
https://omh.ny.gov/
https://omh.ny.gov/
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=4VJFKpZnHI4
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=4VJFKpZnHI4
https://www.downstate.edu/
https://www.downstate.edu/


PAGE 40 BEHAVIORAL HEALTH NEWS ~ SPRING 2024 

Disparities from page 25 
 
(Gaskin & Richard, 2011).” Those num-
bers also excluded the treatment of chil-
dren and adults living in institutional set-
tings (e.g., correctional facilities and psy-
chiatric facilities). 
 

History of Disparities  
 

Prior to 1960, CP was thought of pri-
marily as a physical health condition 
treated through medical interventions. 
This often led to only modest improve-
ments in pain management. In addition, 
retrospective research studies examining 
the history of medication management for 
pain revealed significant differences in the 
administration of pain medication for 
Black and white patients in the US, high-
lighting systematic undertreatment of 
Black adults and children.  

The disproportionately low rate of pain 
treatment was present even when Black 
patients were being treated for specific 
medical diagnoses that caused pain, such 
as the treatment of fractures in the emer-
gency room and appendicitis (Hoffman et 
al., 2016).  

Racially biased beliefs about biological 
differences between Black and white indi-
viduals have been historically document-
ed by scientists and physicians, and for 
centuries, those beliefs were utilized to 
justify the inhumane treatment of Black 
people in medicine.  

While advances in medical, psychologi-
cal, and racial equity research have high-
lighted pervasive racial inequality and 
moved the field toward efforts to elimi-
nate racial health disparities, current re-
search reveals significant cultural bias in 
healthcare and in the treatment of CP 
(Hoffman et al., 2016).  

Research between 2016 and 2021 ex-
poses cultural disparities in the treatment 
and prevalence rates of pain issues in the 
U.S. Hoffman and colleagues published a 
study in 2016 that showed 50% of White 
medical students and residents endorsed 
at least one racially biased belief about 
biological differences between Black and 
white individuals (e.g., Black skin is 
thicker than white skin). The full sample 
of medical students was then shown case 
examples of a white and a Black patient 
experiencing pain. Those medical stu-
dents who held at least one biased belief 
about racial differences rated the Black 
patient’s pain as lower than the white pa-
tient’s pain and provided treatment rec-
ommendations that were less accurate 
than their white counterparts.  

In addition, CDC data from 2016 and 
2021 revealed higher prevalence rates of 
chronic pain for cultural groups, including 
non-Hispanic American Indians or Alas-
kan Natives, Military veterans, women, 
adults who identify as bisexual, individu-
als living in rural areas, and individuals 
living in socioeconomic conditions where 
family income falls below the national 
poverty level.  
 

A New Strategy  
 

Additional research and advancements 
in understanding CP now view pain from 
a biopsychosocial perspective that focuses 
on the biological, psychological, and so-
cial influences on pain perception and the 
causes and effects of CP.  

Given that CP is often comorbid with 
mental health and substance use disorders 

and the complex biopsychosocial interac-
tions impacting them all, it became appar-
ent that a biomedical framework alone 
was not an effective approach for pain 
management. Following devastating re-
sults from the over-use of opioid medica-
tions for pain and extensive research pub-
lished in 2011 by the Institute of Medi-
cine deeming chronic pain as a public 
health issue, in 2016, the US Department 
of Health and Human Services developed 
a national pain strategy proposing the 
need for health professionals across all 
disciplines to engage in treating pain man-
agement (Edmond et al., 2019).  

Best practice standards for treating 
pain now encourage the use of non-
pharmacological approaches when indi-
cated and promote the involvement of 
behavioral health professionals and al-
ternative and complementary therapies. 
While there has been an increase in in-
tegrated healthcare clinics and specialty 
mental health clinics for treating CP, 
the consistent use of multidisciplinary 
teams to address pain from a biopsycho-
social perspective has been slow and 
continues to reveal significant dispari-
ties in access and treatment (Casio & 
Demyan, 2023).  

The pain experiences that have accom-
panied COVID-19 present even more 
urgent and challenging needs for pain 
interventions that require medical profes-
sionals to understand how to validate and 
treat a patient’s experiences of pain, even 
when there is no evidence of physical 
pathology (Abramson, 2022).  
 

The Role of Behavioral 
Health Professionals 

 
Numerous psychological treatments and 

interventions for treating CP have been 
developed and researched since 1960. 
Cognitive behavioral therapy (CBT) is the 
most widely used psychological treat-
ment, with ample research supporting its 
effectiveness in reducing pain and in-
creasing psychological and physical 
health (Jensen & Turk, 2014).  

Research also supports other effective 
interventions, such as mindfulness-based 
interventions and biofeedback (Casio & 
Demyan, 2023). In addition to providing 
psychological interventions, psychologists 
and other behavioral health professionals 
have expertise in assessing, conceptualiz-
ing, and treatment planning from a bi-
opsychosocial perspective, which pro-
vides a complementary area of specialty 

to primary care physicians and other med-
ical staff. Behavioral health professionals 
are typically well versed in facilitating 
and collaborating on multidisciplinary 
teams and can provide consultation on 
understanding the complex bi-directional 
biopsychosocial factors of mental health, 
substance use, and experiences of pain.  

While there is little research on health 
disparities in pain management with be-
havioral health professionals specifically, 
we know all individuals harbor biased 
beliefs that can negatively impact behav-
ior and interactions.  

Psychologists and behavioral health 
professionals are often educated and 
trained in understanding bias and other 
identity and social factors related to cul-
turally sensitive and responsive treatment. 
These areas of expertise are necessary for 
addressing the systematic cultural bias 
and discrimination identified through ex-
tensive research and would contribute to 
more appropriate and adequate treatment 
of all people suffering from CP.  

Behavioral health professionals are also 
highly skilled in building rapport with 
individuals and their caregivers, allowing 
for the development of a trusting relation-
ship where education for individuals and 
families may be better received.  

Behavioral health professionals can 
assist systems of care through the follow-
ing action items specifically related to 
addressing cultural disparities in pain 
management (Sabin, 2020): 
 
 Conduct and facilitate educational pro-

grams with multidisciplinary teams on 
cultural bias, implicit bias and dispari-
ties in pain management to help profes-
sionals gain greater awareness of their 
own biases and implications related to 
treatment disparities. 

 Develop data collection systems that 
track pain assessments and de-
mographics related to race, gender, so-
cioeconomic status, and other cultural 
factors to identify disparities within 
each system of care. 

 Decrease the discretion of individual 
professionals in treating CP by follow-
ing established best practices, guide-
lines, and system protocols. 

 Develop protocols for engaging in com-
prehensive assessments of pain and 
comorbid mental health and/or sub-
stance use conditions that incorporate a 
biopsychosocial, cultural formulation 
for understanding presenting concerns 
that then facilitate treatment planning.  

 Continue conducting research on devel-
oping standard objective measures for 
assessing pain that are not fully reliant 
on patient self-reports and subjective 
interpretations by providers. 

Devereux Advanced Behavioral Health 
is one of the nation’s largest nonprofit 
organizations, providing services, insight, 
and leadership in the evolving field of 
behavioral healthcare. Founded in 1912, 
Devereux operates a comprehensive na-
tional network of clinical, therapeutic, 
educational, and employment programs 
that positively impact the lives of tens of 
thousands of children, adults – and their 
families – every year. The organization’s 
unique approach combines evidence-
based interventions with compassionate 

family engagement.  
With more than 6,000 employees work-

ing in programs across the country, Deve-
reux is a trusted partner for families, 
schools, and communities, serving many 
of our country’s most vulnerable popula-
tions in the areas of autism, intellectual 
and developmental disabilities, specialty 
mental health, education, and foster care. 
For more than a century, Devereux Ad-
vanced Behavioral Health has been guid-
ed by a simple and enduring mission: To 
change lives by unlocking and nurturing 
human potential for people living with 
emotional, behavioral, and cognitive dif-
ferences. www.devereux.org 
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Trauma from page 24 
 
issues (SAMHSA, 2014). School climate 
is a broad term that also encompasses 
prioritizing students’ physical and emo-
tional safety as well as nurturing positive 
and supportive relationships. Empowering 
students by offering choices will provide 
a sense of control and agency. Incorporat-
ing daily rituals such as morning meetings 
or individual check-ins can facilitate posi-
tive adult-student interactions. Finally, 
setting clear, predictable expectations will 
build trust amongst students and staff. 
Staff members can be trained to recognize 
signs of trauma in their students and part-
ner with families to select appropriate 
accommodations to aid in students’ learn-
ing. Teachers may notice students with-
drawing from others, emotional outbursts 
that are more intense and/or more fre-
quent, crying more easily, poor academic 
performance, or sleeping in class. Schools 
can consider accommodations to support 
the child, including reducing assignment 
length, giving extended time, and allow-
ing the child to regularly connect with a 
school-based mental health professional if 
they are experiencing emotional difficul-

ties (NASP School Safety and Crisis Re-
sponse Committee, 2015).  

Additionally, incorporating social and 
emotional curricula can teach both students 
and teachers to identify ways to express 
emotions effectively, choose helpful coping 
strategies to manage difficult emotions, and 
ask for help from others when they are 

struggling. When working with children 
who have experienced trauma, adults 
should prioritize taking care of themselves 
to avoid compassion fatigue, which can 
occur when we are constantly taking care 
of others. Eating three meals a day, drink-
ing plenty of water, and having a consistent 
sleep schedule are a few common self-care 
strategies. Other opportunities can include 
incorporating enjoyable exercise into daily 
routine, like dance or yoga, and practicing a 
simple mindfulness activity, like a body 
scan, which can help keep them alert to any 
changes that might indicate they are experi-
encing compassion fatigue. Staff can devel-
op a “tap-out” system to take a break and 
trade places with other staff members when 
they recognize their emotions are height-
ened so they can ensure that the students’ 
needs are still being met. Importantly, 
adults should have patience and compas-
sion not only for the students they serve but 
for themselves as well.  

Childhood trauma can have lasting neg-
ative impacts, but support from families, 
schools, and communities can help chil-
dren heal. 

 
Jeniffer Cruz, PhD, NCSP, is a licensed 

psychologist in New Jersey and a Nationally 
Certified School Psychologist. She works at 
Behavior Therapy Associates in Somerset, 
New Jersey. She can be reached at 
jcruz@BehaviorTherapyAssociates.com and 
at www.BehaviorTherapyAssociates.com.  
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Gambling from page 24 
 
make it seem socially acceptable. Adoles-
cents may also see gambling as a way to 
make quick money. 

Several predetermined risk factors may 
also contribute to the development of 
problematic gambling behavior in adoles-
cents. These factors include a family histo-
ry of gambling problems or addictive be-
haviors. Mental health conditions, such as 
depression, anxiety, or ADHD. Adoles-
cents from lower socioeconomic back-
grounds as financial stressors can contrib-
ute to the appeal of gambling as a poten-
tial solution. Adolescents with impulsive 
tendencies may be more prone to problem-
atic gambling. The use of substances, such 
as drugs or alcohol, is often associated 
with an increased risk of engaging in prob-
lematic gambling behavior. Insufficient 
parental monitoring and involvement in an 
adolescent's life may also increase risk.  

Understanding these factors can help 
parents, educators, and healthcare profes-
sionals identify and address potential is-
sues before they escalate into problematic 
gambling behavior in adolescents. 

The long-term dangers associated with 
adolescent gambling include gambling 
addictions, financial problems, mental 
health issues, emotional family distress, 
and legal consequences.  

Adolescents may access gambling 

through online platforms, fake IDs, or by 
participating in informal or underground 
gambling activities. To address adolescent 
gambling, parents, educators, and commu-
nities need to take proactive steps to edu-
cate adolescents about the risks of gam-
bling, monitor online activities, imple-
ment parental controls on devices, limit 
access to funds, be a role model, encour-
age healthy hobbies, and encourage open 
communication about finances and deci-
sion-making. 

Warning signs of adolescent gambling 
may include sudden shifts in behavior, 
such as increased secrecy, mood swings, 
irritability, or withdrawal from family and 
friends. A noticeable decline in academic 
performance, missed assignments, or a 
lack of interest in previously enjoyed ac-
tivities. Unexplained money problems, 
frequent borrowing, or stealing to fund 
gambling activities. Constantly talking 
about or being preoccupied with gambling
-related topics, even if it's just casually 
discussing odds or strategies. Changes in 
Social or a shift in friendships, particular-
ly if the new friends are involved in gam-
bling activities. Items of value going 
missing, potentially sold or pawned to 
finance gambling. Engaging in deceptive 
behavior, such as lying about the extent of 
gambling involvement or hiding losses. 
Increased levels of stress, anxiety, or de-
pression may be linked to gambling activ-

ities. Persistent attempts to recover losses 
through continued gambling, leading to a 
cycle of escalating bets. Neglecting re-
sponsibilities at home, school, or work 
due to a focus on gambling. 

If you observe these warning signs in 
an adolescent, it's essential to approach 
the situation with empathy and seek pro-
fessional help from a mental health pro-
fessional or a support organization spe-
cializing in gambling addiction. Cognitive
-behavioral therapy (CBT) is the most 
effective therapy mode for treating gam-
bling disorders. CBT aims to identify and 
modify unhealthy thought patterns and 
behaviors related to gambling. Motiva-
tional interviewing, a client-centered ap-
proach, can also enhance motivation to 
change. Family therapy may help address 
the impact of gambling disorder on rela-
tionships and involve loved ones in the 
recovery process. Support groups like 
Gamblers Anonymous also provide a 
sense of community and understanding. In 
severe cases, medications such as selec-
tive serotonin reuptake inhibitors (SSRIs) 
or opioid antagonists may be considered 
in conjunction with therapy. 

If you or someone you know is strug-
gling with gambling-related issues, don't 
hesitate to reach out for support. The Na-
tional Problem Gambling Helpline is 1-
800-522-4700. The helpline is open 24 
hours a day, seven days a week. The help-

line is 100% confidential and connects the 
caller to local health and government or-
ganizations that can assist with their gam-
bling addiction. 
 

Richard Anemone has a master's degree 
in psychology and is licensed as a mental 
health counselor in New York State. He 
owns a private practice, Behavioral Men-
tal Health Counseling PLLC, in which he 
provides counseling as well as training, 
presentations, and technical support to 
individuals, families, groups, and organi-
zations with a specialty in gambling ad-
diction, anger management, intellectual 
developmental disabilities, and psychiat-
ric disorders. Richard is also the Senior 
Vice President of the IDD division at ICL. 
ICL helps New Yorkers with behavioral 
health challenges live healthy and ful-
filling lives by providing comprehensive 
housing, health care, and recovery ser-
vices. He can be reached at Rich-
ard.Anemone@BMHC-NY.com. 
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NAMI-NYC from  page 39 
 

and remaining open to all feedback and 
insights from the community. Although we 
focused on the Hispanic/Latino communi-
ty, we kept our interviews open to anyone 
who wanted to chat. We authored an origi-
nal report detailing Black, brown, and AA-

PI community findings. Many of these 
individuals shared the difficulties of talking 
about mental health in immigrant families. 
As a result, this PSA now stands as a foun-
dational resource for future programming 
and campaigns, which could be tailored, for 
example, to New Yorkers in mono-lingual 
Chinese or Arabic communities. 

This project was funded by the New 
York State Office of Mental Health and 
the New York State Tax Check-off Funds 
for Mental Health Stigma Reduction.  

For over 40 years, NAMI-NYC has 
been a lifeline for individuals and fami-
lies affected by mental illness. We urge 
you to utilize our PSA, available at 

www.naminyc.org/psa, to spread aware-
ness and connect individuals with the 
necessary resources. Whether you're 
embarking on your own PSA project or 
seeking guidance, we welcome your 
questions and are eager to share our 
insights and feedback. To get in touch, 
visit www.naminyc.org/helpline. 
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Your Options from page 25 

• How was I harmed in ways I am aware 

of and may not realize? 

• What self-care resources can I access? 

• How can I stay regulated, manage early 

warning signs, and address crises? 

3. Collect evidence (What can you 

prove?) 

• How can I appropriately document pos-

sible stigma, microaggressions, and/or 

discrimination? 

• How can I keep an open mind that it 

may not be intentional, or it may be my 

sensitivities contributing to my reaction? 

4. Cultivate support (Who can help you?) 

• How can I decide who in my personal 

and professional life or what third par-

ties I can contact for support? 

• What are appropriate ways to seek support? 

• How can I be mindful in navigating the 

awkwardness, professionalism norms, 

and vicarious trauma that comes from 

my sharing my story with supporters? 

5. Consider your rights, options, and lim-

itations (Should I respond? How?) 

• What are the relevant organization poli-

cies, laws, and rights that may help me? 

• What are the practical realities that may 

make it not feasible for me to exercise 

those options (delays, burdens, back-

lashes, ambiguities, my sensitivities) 

• What are the possible self-protective, 

collaborative, and assertive options to 

move forward, and how can I pursue 

them? 

• What choice do I want to make (not 

what anyone says I should do)? 

An Example of a Protective Response 
 

Even if we believe we are sure that 

something stigmatizing happened, we 

may decide to protect ourselves from 

the stress or backlash from speaking up. 

For instance, as a speaker living with 

bipolar disorder, there have been many 

times that participants in one of my pro-

grams or professionals who have hired 

me to speak say upsetting things that 

feel demeaning. 

Once, someone told me, “I never would 

have guessed you were bipolar until you 

started speaking so fast at the end,” - and 

sadly, this is amongst many upsetting 

comments I have regularly encountered. 

Even though, in my head, I had clarified 

that this was stigma, my coping was to let 

it go rather than deal with the difficult 

conversation about addressing it.  
Kevin Nadal, an expert on microaggres-

sions, prepared a guide to respond to mi-

croaggressions that contain similar advice 

- microaggressions are so frequent, so 

upsetting, and so hard to discuss that his 

guide suggests people consider whether it 

is safe to bring up the issue and worth 

doing at all given the pain. The point is 

not to trivialize the immense trauma from 

each instance of stigma - but rather to 

acknowledge that the world is an ocean 

filled with endless possible stigma, and 

we might drown if we try to fight every 

drop of it. 
 

An Example of 
A Collaborative Response 

 
Part of my work has been addressing 

published guidance that teaches people 

discriminatory practices regarding indi-

viduals with mental illnesses, including 

guidance with inappropriate recommen-

dations to screen out parties who have 

these conditions or otherwise treat them 

differently. This is often illegal under the 

Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA), 

but many people sadly do not realize that 

mental illness discrimination is an issue, 

so they often don’t believe they are doing 

anything wrong by publishing instruc-

tions to screen people with mental health 

conditions. You can read some examples 

of this problem in the dispute resolution 

world in an article at https://bit.ly/

ABADiscrimination. 
In this case, because this information 

was published, it was easy for me to clari-

fy that the problem was real and to collect 

evidence from the published guidance. 

Coping is still important - it is painful to 

read this type of material, to appreciate 

how these kinds of policies and practices 

are demeaning countless people with 

mental health problems like mine, and to 

encounter the indifferent, confused, or 

avoidant reactions of people who might 

be dismissive when I bring it to their at-

tention - so I cultivate support in my life 

from my therapist, my friends and support 

system, and other professional contacts 

before I address the issue. Then, I consid-

er my optio`ns, and because I am a medi-

ator, I offer ways to collaborate and dis-

cuss the issue. This has often led to great 

successes and learning opportunities, in-

cluding people changing their policies 

and publications. For examples of this in 

the dispute resolution world, visit 

mhsafe.org/preventing/ and mediate.com/

ending-mental-illness-discrimination-in-dis 
pute-resolution-and-beyond-some-2023-up 
dates. 

Collaborating with others can be hard. 

It involves being vulnerable, forgiving, 

and showing empathy to the idea that 

most people are not purposely stigmatiz-

ing someone. It requires self-care as well. 
 

An Example of 
An Assertive Response 

 
There are also times, after considering 

our options, we may decide to file some 

kind of complaint. Organizations such as 

schools or workplaces have non-
discrimination and non-retaliation policies 

to protect you from backlashes after mak-

ing a complaint, though they are some-

times poorly implemented. 
We also have legal protections under 

federal, state, and local disability laws. I 

have had some success in filing com-

plaints, including times when discrimina-

tory content was changed. But even these 

successes can be taxing – it can be pain-

ful to sometimes see my complaint dis-

missed right away, to experience cold 

reactions from various institutions, to 

have my pain trivialized, and to endure 

long, sometimes costly, investigatory 

processes only to receive little infor-

mation at the end.  
One goal of the Mental Health Safe 

Project is to give people tools to make 

the complaint process easier and to also 

fill in the gaps from many of the “Know 

Your Rights” circulating pamphlets. Yes, 

you have rights, but sometimes asserting 

them can be very hard. You often have 

to be able to collect tangible proof, 

which is difficult when someone is not 

publishing harmful content, as I men-

tioned earlier. There is a lot to cope with 

because you are often a lone individual 

engaging in an adversarial process with 

some institution. At mhsafe.org/options, 

you can see some resources to help you 

consider your next steps while having a 

full sense of the burdens and backlash 

that may come with some of these more 

formal processes. Additional assertive 

options include speaking up to tell your 

story and seeking help from less formal 

advocacy efforts. 
 

Conclusion: Stigma Hurts, 
and You Have Choices 

 
Every act of stigma is hurtful, disrup-

tive, and it can seem like its effects ripple 

forever. Unfortunately, the world is filled 

with mental illness stigma, and people 

living with mental health problems are 

affected by it regularly, in some ways that 

can be seen and in many ways that cannot. 

Sadly, many of the perpetrators of stigma 

do not know they are doing it. They are 

hurt, too, because they create problems 

they do not understand. 
It is impossible to notice, prevent, or 

address every act of stigma. But when we 

choose to reflect on something that hap-

pened and make our own choices about 

how to handle it, we can use the five-step 

(5 C’s) framework to clarify what hap-

pened, to cope with the feelings, and take 

care of ourselves, to collect evidence, to 

cultivate support, and to consider our op-

tions of how we can move forward - per-

haps by acting protectively toward our-

selves, or by collaborating with others, or 

by asserting our rights. 
 

See more information and campaign 

images at www.mhsafe.org/options. 
Dan Berstein, MHS is a mediator and 

mental health expert living with bipolar 

disorder, working to help people use con-

flict resolution best practices to have em-

powering mental health communication 

and prevent mental illness discrimina-

tion.  As Chief Advocacy Officer of Mind-

quity, Dan works to help legal organiza-

tions have resources to prevent inadvert-

ent discrimination and respond when it 

occurs.  Dan also wrote the American Bar 

Association book, Mental Health and 

Conflicts: A Handbook for Empowerment, 

and he leads advocacy efforts through the 

Mental Health Safe Project, with free 

resources available at www.mhsafe.org. 

Dan Berstein, MHS 
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